9/17/24, 3:34 PM Gmail - Re: Delivery to Germany

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Delivery to Germany
1 message

Andreas Bosse <andreas-bosse@hotmail.com> 17 September 2024 at 15:19
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Please send the one you have in Stock...i'm in a rush;)

Am 17.09.2024 um 15:37 schrieb Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:

Many thanks Andreas,

Payments can take a day or so to arrive in our account.

We do have one of these sensors in stock. The manufacture date is July 2023. This is an
older sensor than we usually like to send out, but if you are in a rush you could have this
one. It has the full 15 months guarantee and is in the sealed sensor bag.

Alternatively, we are expecting fresh stock in mid October.

Please let me know how you would like us to proceed.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and
in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use
email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken
or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 17 Sept 2024 at 14:18, Andreas Bosse <andreas-bosse@hotmail.com> wrote:
Done...l transferred the money.

Phone: +4917684634153

Thank you!

Am 16.09.2024 um 14:13 schrieb Kate Griffiths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:

Thank you Andreas,

Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days. | am happy to
make any changes you require.

Please could | also ask for a telephone number to add to your
account?

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to
work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else
is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or
any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed
from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542
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On Mon, 16 Sept 2024 at 10:45, Andreas Bosse <andreas-
bosse@hotmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Kate,
| only need 1pc. Here my Adress:
Andreas Bosse
Neyeweg 16
40625 Dusseldorf
Germany
Many thank! Br Andreas
Am 16.09.2024 um 11:34 schrieb Kate Giriffiths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>:
Good morning Andreas,

Thank you for your email. Yes, we deliver to Germany.

The price breaks for part number 0110660 - oxygen sensor
OOI103 in euros are as follows:

3-10=¢€ 11 or more = €
83.30 each 78.40 each
EXW EXW

1=€ |[|2=€88.20
98.00 |leach EXW

If you are able to let me know your delivery and invoice
addresses, | can issue a proforma invoice valid for 30 days
showing carriage charges and insurance. | would also
need to know how many your require.

We are expecting more stock of this sensor to be available
mid October.

| await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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Gmail - Re: Delivery to Germany
Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and
admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please
continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be
legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email

by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure,
copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would
like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 16 Sept 2024 at 08:40, Main Account
<viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message --—-------

From: Andreas Bosse <andreas-bosse@hotmail.com>

Date: Sat, 14 Sept 2024 at 12:18
Subject: Delivery to Germany
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, do you deliver to Germany? | Need this part...

001103 Oxygen Sensor

Part Number: 0110660

Regular price£72.00$ale price

VAT and Shipping Calculated at Checkout

BR, Andreas

Von meinem iPhone gesendet

<MVM152220.pdf>
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