
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: ORDER R-49V, OOM111-M, MOX 4
Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 16 September 2024 at 09:25
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we process the order for An AN Import.

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Phương Thái Thi Trinh <trinhphuong@anantrading.vn>
Date: Mon, 16 Sept 2024 at 08:00
Subject: ORDER R-49V, OOM111-M, MOX 4
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,
I want to order below detail:
10pcs of  R-49V
5pcs of  maquet sensor OOM111-M
1pcs of MOX 4
I don't need COO for this order.
Do you have them in your stock? Please send me proforma invoice.
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Thank you & Best Regards,

Ms. Trinh Phuong

An An Import Export Co.,Ltd

109/11/19 4th Street, 16th Ward, Go Vap Dist, Ho Chi Minh City, VN

Tel: +84 987 546 072

Email: TrinhPhuong@anantrading.vn
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