
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: New Order
Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 8 August 2024 at 10:19
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Wynfrey Wong <wynfrey.wong@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 8 Aug 2024 at 04:18
Subject: Re: New Order
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Janine,

I would like to put another purchase order of 10 pieces of oxygen sensor. Please send me a proforma invoice at your earliest convenience.

Thank you.

Healthy regards,

Wynfrey Wong
HealthBound Medical

On Thu, May 9, 2024 at 6:55 PM Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good Afternoon,

Thank you for your payment.

I have passed this on to our accounts team

Once it has been processed we will dispatch your goods and email you a tracking number.

I have also requested for your invoices to be separate.

Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
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On Thu, 9 May 2024 at 09:00, Wynfrey Wong <wynfrey.wong@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Janine.

Payment of 11 pieces of oxygen sensors has been or will be soon transferred to your company. Please pay attention to it.

When you issue an invoice of this order, please do me a favor splitting it into two invoices, one 10 pieces with all additional expenses and a single oxygen sensor only.

Thank you so much.

Wynfrey Wong
HealthBound Medical

On Tue, Apr 30, 2024 at 5:41 PM Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good Morning,

Thank you for your email,

I've attached the proforma as you requested.

Just to let you know, the goods will only be dispatched once we receive payment.

Our stock levels are low on this item, there may be a lead time of 6-8 weeks.

If you need any other info, please don't hesitate to contact us.
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Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
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On Tue, 30 Apr 2024 at 10:07, Wynfrey Wong <wynfrey.wong@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Janine,

I would like to place a new order at your company. Please compose an invoice of 11 pieces of Teledyne Oxygen Sensor UFO 130-2.

Thank you very much,

Wynfrey Wong
HealthBound Medical
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