29/08/2024, 10:36 Gmail - Fwd: Viamed - EBME exhibition
M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Viamed - EBME exhibition

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 29 August 2024 at 09:25
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please send a proforma invoice for 5x R-22Vi, account CID30186
Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Shahram Behvandi <behvandi@pekco-uk.com>
Date: Wed, 28 Aug 2024 at 21:48

Subject: Re: Viamed - EBME exhibition

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

I hope you are well, please issue an P/| for 5 pcs of follow item ;
0110020 - Oxygen sensor R-22Vi OR OOM102

I am looking forward to hearing from you.

Kindest Regards,

Shahram Behvandi, Managing Director
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Pars Eltiyam Kala Ltd.

Email: behvandi@pekco-uk.com

Mobile: +447498458515

Flat 2, 162 Fitzjohn Avenue, Barnet, EN5 2HP, UK

On 10/07/2024 12:09 BST Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Shahram
Thank you very much for your reply.

Our labelled version of the OOM102 is as follows:
0110020 - Oxygen sensor R-22Vi = £34 EXW
We have stock available.

Production date is May 2024

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 10 Jul 2024 at 12:05, Shahram Behvandi <behvandi@pekco-uk.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Good morning. | hope you are well.

Many thanks for sending the information and price for my inquiries. | am interested in the item 'OOM102 Oxygen sensor with your label’, please
give your best offer for 25 pcs and other questions is, what is the production date? Do you have it in stock?

Again, | appreciate your comment and offer.

I look forward to hearing from you.

Kindest Regards,

Shahram Behvandi, Managing Director
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Pars Eltiyam Kala Ltd.

Email: behvandi@pekco-uk.com

Mobile: +447498458515

Flat 2, 162 Fitzjohn Avenue, Barnet, EN5 2HP, UK

On 04/07/2024 16:02 BST Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Shahram Behvandi

Thank you very much for taking the time to visit us at the EBME conference last week, it was a pleasure to meet you.
Further to our meeting, please find some information and our distributor pricing relating to the products we discussed.
0111265 - Maxtec Ultramax ultrasonic O2 analyser (for O2 concentrators) = £478.40 EXW

OOM102 Oxygen sensor - we offer the same sensor with our label:
0110020 - Oxygen sensor R-22Vi = £34 EXW

OOM102-1 Oxygen sensor - we offer the same sensor with our label:
0110019 - Oxygen sensor R-17Vi = £34 EXW

I look forward to your response, please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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