
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: NM sensors
1 message

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> 27 August 2024 at 09:33
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Please process the attached VST order from Muro:

25 x 8010054 at £ 56.40 each
  1 x UPS (to add)

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Michael Holm <mh@muro-ccr.com>
Date: Mon, 26 Aug 2024 at 14:00
Subject: Re: NM sensors
To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Hello Steve

Here is the PO Sorry but I’ve been on an exhibition so a bit behind.

Price just indicated.

Kind regards
Michael Holm

MURO-CCR ApS  · Industrivej 15 · 8830 Tjele · Denmark
Phone direct: +45 20847000
Email:mh@muro-ccr.com
Web: https://muro-ccr.com

Den 22. aug. 2024 kl. 17.08 skrev Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>:

Hi Michael

Good news, we can ship the sensors either tomorrow or Monday.

Can you please supply a purchase order number to process the agreed order for 25 x 8010054 R17
MURO oxygen sensors. We can ship them to you using UPS Express Saver.

Regards

Steve

On Mon, 19 Aug 2024 at 08:34, Michael Holm <mh@muro-ccr.com> wrote:
Hello Steve

Thanks for your replay.

Good you found it in house.

Looking forward to get them.
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Kind regards
Michael Holm

MURO-CCR ApS  · Industrivej 15 · 8830 Tjele · Denmark
Phone direct: +45 20847000
Email:mh@muro-ccr.com
Web: https://muro-ccr.com

Den 16. aug. 2024 kl. 20.07 skrev Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>:

Hi Michael

Apologies for the delay in getting back to you.

Unfortunately we found a problem is the last QA stages of production.
This has been identified, but has meant that we have to produce the
sensors again. So, unfortunately there will be another two weeks
delay.

All I can do is apologize and provide assurances that once approved,
any subsequent production batches will take the normal 4-6 weeks
delivery schedule.

Kind regards

Steve

On Mon, 12 Aug 2024 at 12:41, Michael Holm <mh@muro-ccr.com> wrote:

Hi again Steve

Pls. give me a feedback on this one.

Hi Steve

Any news when the sensors will be ready.

We have got the first orders and will like to make our own test before we
send them on the market. :)

Kind regards
Michael Holm

MURO-CCR ApS  · Industrivej 15 · 8830 Tjele · Denmark
Phone direct: +45 20847000
Email:mh@muro-ccr.com
Web: https://muro-ccr.com

--

Steve

Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.
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Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

--
 
 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

--
 
 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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