20/08/2024, 11:01 Gmail - Re: Order 3169/ 20.08.2024

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order 3169/ 20.08.2024

1 message

Office Meditech <office@meditech.ro> 20 August 2024 at 10:56
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Sorry for the mistakes.

1. We need the micro size.

2. | will change the price, we don't have the new price list for this year. (I attached the last one, from 2023).

3. We need 3 pcs of VM-2160 with an adult finger sensor and 2 pcs of VM-2160 with a pediatric ear sensor.

Thank you!

Nicoleta Guarza
Marketing Manager

Meditech SRL
VAT: RO14779840

Str. Margeanului nr. 8C
430014 Baia Mare
Romania

Phone: +40 262 274161

Fax: +40 372 876471

General Manager: +40 722 591519

Technical Manager: +40 723 635095

Assistant Manager: +40 727 367131

Account Manager: +40 732 591515
Procurement Specialist: +40 726 591519
Marketing and Sales Manager: +40 723 328969
Marketing Manager: +40 773 987674

Email: office@meditech.ro
Web: www.meditech.ro / www.defibrilare.ro

Confidentialitatea datelor cu caracter personal este importanta pentru noi. Politica de confidentialitate Meditech o
gasiti aici.
On Tue, Aug 20, 2024 at 12:48 PM Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,
Thank you for your order.
Please could | check the following with you?
Line 1: You have used part number 1114005 which is the part number for the regular size 32 - 38 cm - ref.
R300PO01. but you have also mention
R300P03 which is the reference for the micro size (11140074) 20 - 26 cm. | have attached a leaflet.
Line 2: the correct price is €345 each for 0012165.
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Line 3: your description is for a different item to the part number 0014850. | think | have not quite understood this
line.....but | have used part number 0012165...

I have attached a snip of the draft proforma that | have created, but | believe it may need to be changed.

Please could | also check the correct address is:

Delivery Address Invoice Address
Meditech S.R.L Meditech S.R.L
8C Margeanului Street 8C Margeanului Street
Baia Mare Baia Mare
Maramures Maramures
430014 430014
Romania ﬁq@eln_i_a‘ o
1114005 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Regular 500  48.40 24,200.00

Tariff 9018199000

CoO United States Ref. R300P01

Pack of 20

0012165 Viamed Pulse Oximeter VM-2160 SMARTsat 3 345.00 1,035.00
Tariff 90181990-00

CoO E.U. Germany Standard accessories included:

1 x PC Software

1 x USB Data Cable

1 x Silicone Protective Cover

1 x Lanyard

3 x AA Batteries

Language package version: Central European
including: English, Afrikaans, Dutch, French, German,
Hungarian, Italian, Polish, Portuguese and Spanish

0014752 Pulse Oximetry Silicone Finger Sensor 3 0.00 0.00

Tariff 90181990-00 .
CoOEU. Gormany  Viamed SMARTsat - Adult - SC7500VM

Cable Length: 1.2m

0012165 Viamed Pulse Oximeter VM-2160 SMARTsat 2 345.00 690.00

angfgol}.aégﬁﬂﬁ% Standard accessaories included:

1 x PC Software
1 x USB Data Cable
1 x Silicone Protective Cover

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Tue, 20 Aug 2024 at 09:46, Office Meditech <office@meditech.ro> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Please find attached the following order.
Let us know the delivery time.

Looking forward to hearing from you.
Thank you!

Kind regards
Nicoleta Guarza
Marketing Manager

Meditech SRL
VAT: RO14779840

Str. Margeanului nr. 8C
430014 Baia Mare
Romania

Phone: +40 262 274161

Fax: +40 372 876471

General Manager: +40 722 591519

Technical Manager: +40 723 635095

Assistant Manager: +40 727 367131

Account Manager: +40 732 591515
Procurement Specialist: +40 726 591519
Marketing and Sales Manager: +40 723 328969
Marketing Manager: +40 773 987674

Email: office@meditech.ro
Web: www.meditech.ro / www.defibrilare.ro
Location: https://maps.app.goo.gl/148GiCtj9SgzznYQ7

Confidentialitatea datelor cu caracter personal este importanta pentru noi. Politica de confidentialitate Meditech o
gasiti aici.

M 230914_EUR Distributor Price List - VM-2160 SMARTsat ID129204.pdf
89K
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