
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: TR-PO-240603-1
1 message

Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> 20 August 2024 at 09:24
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate 

Please send without insurance 

Best Regards
Alireza

On Tue, Aug 20, 2024 at 9:45 AM Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Ali,

The warehouse team have asked me to enquire whether or not you would like insurance added to your
shipment as the total cost of the goods will be $7,948.80.

The costs of carriage with and without insurance are as follows:

$106.83 carriage cost without insurance
$186.32 carriage cost with insurance

Once I have this information, the warehouse can proceed.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, 16 Aug 2024 at 12:23, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Ali, we will send by UPS then.

We will email the delivery note and invoice when the goods leave our warehouse.
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Please see attached the ones previously sent to you.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, 16 Aug 2024 at 12:20, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate 
Yes 
Please send them 
Thank you so much 
Please send the invoices for both shipments by email too 

Best regards 
Alireza 

On Fri, 16 Aug 2024 at 13:09, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi,

20 were shipped previously - delivery note attached.  We have 60 to send.  We need to know how you would
like them to be shipped?  Is UPS ok?

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, 16 Aug 2024 at 12:03, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello Kate 

How many did you send ? How many left ? 
If it is ready please send them. 

Best regards 
Alireza 

On Fri, 16 Aug 2024 at 12:25, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Ali,

The weights and dimensions for the second part of your order are as follows:

3 x 64x50x35cm @ 7.80kg each and 
2 x 64x50x35cm @ 8kg each

Please could I ask how you would like these to be shipped?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 10:55, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi again Ali,

The warehouse have asked me to confirm with you how you would like the remainder of
your order to be shipped please?  Would it be UPS? 

Going forward, would you like us to use UPS for your orders?

Many thanks.
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Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 10:42, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you Ali, we will do so.  We will not be able to ship today as changing the paperwork for an
order that has already been picked/packed is time consuming.  We will email a tracking number
when the goods leave our warehouse.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 10:23, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
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Please send by UPS and add to the invoice 

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 11:21, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you for your reply.

The cost for UPS for the 20 x  4420826 would be $46.03.

Are you happy for us to ship this way?

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in
the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 09:46, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate
I can revise the PO and resend 
I have only DHL account and it is very expensive in comparison with other curriers 

If you can't accept the revised order or send by your FedEx or UPS account, please send by
DHL 
Ecconomy service and use our DHL account 

My DHL import account is 
954-57 29 12

Best regards 
Alireza 

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 10:41, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Your purchase order requested EXW for you to use your own courier.  If you would like to
use Fedex we would need your Fedex account number.  Or you could send us an
account number for another courier eg. DHL or TNT and then we can arrange it for you.

If you want to use any other courier (not Fedex/DHL/TNT)  then you would need to
arrange it yourself.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely
and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue
to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 09:27, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate

Please send with FedEx or whatever you know is better. 
Add shipment charges to invoice.

Best regards 
Alireza 

On Thu, 20 Jun 2024 at 10:24, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

The weights and dimensions you need for your order TR-PO-240603-1 are as follows:

1 x 64 x 50 x 37 cm @ 7.80 kg 
and 1 x 64 x 50 x 37 cm @ 5.60 kg

This is to ship 20 x 4420826 (part shipment)

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work
remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.
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E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
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