
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Statement from Vandagraph Ltd for Italgoods di Guido Lapucci CID5540
1 message

Italgoods <info@italgoods.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good Afternoon Ryan
I paid the invoices.
I would like to order
2 r41 van
5 r17 van
3 cell like the NRC D-41
Thank You
Guido

Il giorno 9 ago 2024, alle ore 15:25, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> ha scritto:

Hi Guido

Unfortunately we no longer have your card details as we switched on to a new secure system. 
Please follow the link below to make your card payment. You will also have the opportunity to save your card details securely so we can use them for future orders if you wish to d

https://app.squareup.com/pay-invoice/inv:0-ChCNtoqqukOtQXh6hjLKi9J4EIgN

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Italgoods <info@italgoods.com>
Date: Tue, 6 Aug 2024 at 18:55
Subject: Re: Statement from Vandagraph Ltd for Italgoods di Guido Lapucci CID5540
To: <helen.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Helen!
Sorry for the late answer, I’m pretty busy in this period.
Well I thought that You had billed in the past on mmi credit.
If You have not done it, do You still have the info about my card?
Regards
Guido

Il giorno 2 ago 2024, alle ore 12:42, Vandagraph email <messaging-service@post.xero.com> ha scritto:

 
Vandagraph Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam

Please find attached the statement of your account.

If any invoices are overdue please can you arrange payment as soon as possible or let
us know if there is a problem.

If you have already made payment for these invoices, please can you send the
remittance so we can allocate them to your account accordingly.

Kind regards

Zoey

 
 <Statement for Italgoods di Guido Lapucci CID5540  As At 31Jul2024.pdf>
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