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M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: MAXventuri IFU

1 message

Lifetech eco limited <lifetechmedicalsuppliers@gmail.com> 12 August 2024 at 09:23
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

I have just received a call fro the hospital,

We need to add 2 more inits,

Please amend te invoice to 2 more so total will be three.
Sorry for this.

Br

Vitus Muga

Technical Director

Lifetech Eco Limited

Kabarnet Road(Off Gong Road)
Nine Planet

Mars 3

Email: lifetechmedicalsuppliers@gmail.com
Web: www.lifetechsuppliers.org
P.o Box: 45391-00100
NAIROBI, KENYA
(+254)727098547

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION

This electronic transmission and any documents attached hereto, may contain confidential and/or legally
privileged information. The information is intended only for use by the recipient named above. If you
have received this electronic message in error, please notify the sender and delete the electronic
message. Any disclosure, copying, or use of the contents of information received in error is strictly
prohibited.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

On Mon, Aug 12, 2024 at 11:19 AM Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Vitus,

Thank you for your reply, please see attached updated proforma invoice as requested.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 12 Aug 2024 at 02:31, Lifetech eco limited <lifetechmedicalsuppliers@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Please re issue it.
I will be in the office today to sign the final cheque.

BR

Vitus Muga

Technical Director

Lifetech Eco Limited

Kabarnet Road(Off Gong Road)
Nine Planet

Mars 3

Email: lifetechmedicalsuppliers@gmail.com
Web: www.lifetechsuppliers.org
P.o Box: 45391-00100
NAIROBI, KENYA
(+254)727098547

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION

This electronic transmission and any documents attached hereto, may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. The information is intended only for use by the recipient named above.
If you have received this electronic message in error, please notify the sender and delete the
electronic message. Any disclosure, copying, or use of the contents of information received in error is
strictly prohibited.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

On Sun, Aug 11, 2024 at 5:18 PM Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,

Just a quick email to let you know that proforma invoice MVM150994 expires tomorrow (12th August) our
system requires me to delete it. | can of course issue another proforma invoice at any time.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 11 Jul 2024 at 11:47, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Vitus

Please find your amended proforma invoice attached.

We have changed the blender to the one we discussed, the MaxVenturi. This device only requires an O2
hose, | have added one to the proforma but we can remove this if your clients have them available or you
wish to obtain one locally.

Please let us know if you have any questions or concerns.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 9 Jul 2024 at 17:33, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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