
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma
g.a.nadeem amin <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com> 10 June 2024 at 09:37
Reply-To: "g.a.nadeem amin" <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com>
To: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Yes I know but I want to changes in this performa invoice. Please change in the order as new list. I want to remove some items.

Yahoo Mail: Search, organise, conquer

On Mon, 10 Jun 2024 at 1:30 pm, Aqib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hello 

Good morning 

You currently have a proforma invoice already on our system, (Attached)

Can you please make payment for that so I can process another proforma for you.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

On Mon, 10 Jun 2024 at 08:39, CM TRADERS <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com> wrote:
Good Morning 🌞Aqib

Sorry for late reply.

I review my demands. New request is following.

Oxygen sensor purchase order.
1. R-44V (20).
2. OOM111-M(10).
3. R-49V (10).
4. Viamed oxygen sensor R-23V (20)

Please send new performa invoice.
Also give account details for payment. I want transfer payment via UK account.

Muhammad Nadeem Amin
What's app. 00923334302696

On Tue, 28 May 2024, 7:44 pm Aqib Majeed, <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello Nadeem 

Good afternoon

The weight and dimensions unboxed are 31x31x25cm, 3.4kg.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered,
but please continue to use email where possible. 

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

On Tue, 28 May 2024 at 14:36, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello Nadeem

Good afternoon

Thank you for your email to amend the proforma

Please see attached below for your amended proforma invoice detailing the price and product you require including carriage costs.

This proforma invoice is only valid for 30 days

Can you have a look and see if all details on the proforma including addresses are correct or if any amendments are required.

If you are happy and wish to proceed, please make payment for the total amount stated on the proforma, I do need to advise the proforma is in UK GBP.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

On Tue, 28 May 2024 at 13:48, CM TRADERS <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi, Aqib Majeed,

Please add this to the performance Invoice.
R-23V Oxygen Sensor
Part Number: 0110023. 30pcs

Muhammad Nadeem Amin
CM Traders
+923334302696

On Thu, 23 May 2024, 1:51 pm Nadeem Amin, <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com> wrote:
Thanks for informing. Will you please give packing details without cardboard boxes 📦. 

On 22 May 2024 3:56 pm, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello Nadeem

Good morning

Thank you for your order with Ryan.

Please see attached below for your proforma invoice detailing the price and product you require including carriage costs.

This proforma invoice is only valid for 30 days
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Can you have a look and see if all details on the proforma including addresses are correct or if any amendments are required.

If you are happy and wish to proceed, please make payment for the total amount stated on the proforma, I do need to advise the proforma is in UK GBP.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------
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