
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN139525-1
1 message

Tony Andrews <tony@crystaldiversmu.com> 25 July 2024 at 10:23
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Emma Andrews <emma@crystaldiversmu.com>

Hi Ryan,

Sure thing, my guests leaves early Saturday morning so it need to arrive tomorrow with signed deliver if you can help?
The address is as follows

Lindholme Barn Hill Road, Coleford, Gloucestershire, GL16 7BL.

Also send over the pro forma and my wife (emma) will make payment today.

Much appreciated! 

Regards
Tony

Anthony Andrews
PADI Course Director
Training Development Manager | Crystal Divers Mauritius
PADI 5 Star Instructor Development Centre

+230 5803 3266

tony@crystaldiversmu.com

www.crystaldiversmu.com

La Colline, Bala Street, Bain Boeuf

On Thu, 25 Jul 2024 at 13:19, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Tony

We have the sensors in stock and I can try to get them out today for you, please can you give me the
delivery address and I will start the ball rolling.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 25 Jul 2024 at 07:01, Tony Andrews <tony@crystaldiversmu.com> wrote:
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Good morning all,

I am urgently requiring X2 Oxygen sensors for the R-17VANS/N:106877. Firstly, do you have them in stock, if so
could you send them out today which would allow one of my guests to bring them to me on Saturday.

I eagerly await your response, my wife Emma is copied into this email and will be able to assist with payment and
UK shipping details.

Kind Regards,
Tony 

On Wed, 19 Oct 2022 at 11:58, <accounts@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Please find attached invoice(s) from Vandagraph Ltd.

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Regards
Accounts Department
Vandagraph Ltd
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.

--

Anthony Andrews
PADI Course Director
Training Development Manager | Crystal Divers Mauritius
PADI 5 Star Instructor Development Centre

+230 5803 3266

tony@crystaldiversmu.com

www.crystaldiversmu.com

La Colline, Bala Street, Bain Boeuf
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