
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: New Order BTL OS51358
1 message

Stanimira Savova Dimitrova <dimitrovass@btl.bg> 19 July 2024 at 08:06
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Oure order is for 10pcs , please correct in the  quotation :)

Kind Regards

BTL Industries JSC will be on summer holiday from 05th August till 09th August 2024.

BTL Industries JSC ще бъде в летен отпуск от 5-ти Август до 9-ти август 2024 година.

Stanimira Dimitrova

Purchasing dept.
Tel: +359 894310276

BTL Industries JSC
30 Peshtersko shouse blvd., Plovdiv 4002, Bulgaria

dimitrovass@btl.bg
www.btl.bg | www.btlaesthetics.com
 

NOTICE: This communication and any attachments are confidential and may contain privileged information or copyright material. Any unauthorized use,

copying, review or disclosure is prohibited.

ЗАБЕЛЕЖКА: Това съобщение и всички прикачени файлове са поверителни и могат да съдържат поверителна информация или материали с
авторски права. Всяко неразрешено използване, копиране, споделяне или разкриване е забранено.

On Thu, Jul 18, 2024 at 5:39 PM Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon, 

Thank you for your order.

There is a quotation on our system -  QVM150770 (attached).  Before I process your proforma invoice, please could
I ask if this is no longer required?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 18 Jul 2024 at 15:11, Dimitrova Stanimira Savova <dimitrovass@btl.bg> wrote:
Good day

My name is Stanimira Dimitrova, I am your contact person for BTL, for me will be pleasure to work together.
Please, find attached our new order. I am expecting your confirmation.

Have a nice day!

Stanimira Dimitrova
Purchasing dept.
BTL Industries JSC
30 Peshtersko shouse blvd., Plovdiv 4002, Bulgaria
Tel : +359 894 310 276
dimitrovass@btl.bg
www.btl.bg | www.btlaesthetics.com
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