
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: O2 cells
Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 11 July 2024 at 15:09
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we send a proforma invoice.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Frederick ELASRI <f.elasri@2mt-medical.com>
Date: Thu, 11 Jul 2024 at 14:32
Subject: RE: O2 cells
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

 

Could you please send me an urgent PI for :

 

6x R-49V
2x R-47V
2x equivalent to OOM-111 for MySignO2
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Regards,

 

Frédérick ELASRI

Ingénieur Biomédical et Directeur

T : 06 07 42 50 62

 

2MT

29, chemin de la Violette

31240 L’UNION

Tel : 05 62 87 54 00 _ Fax : 05 62 87 51 67

Email : contact@2MT-medical.com

 

De : Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Envoyé : jeudi 11 juillet 2024 14:15
À : Frederick ELASRI <f.elasri@2mt-medical.com>
Objet : Re: O2 cells

 

Hi Frederick

 

0110581 Oxygen sensor OOM202 = EUR €36 each EXW

0110582 Oxygen sensor OOM204 = EUR €60 each EXW

 

Delivery time would be approximately 4-6 weeks, but we can offer our labelled version (same sensor) in place of these sensors and we have them available from stock:

 

OOM202: 0110049 Oxygen sensor R-49V = EUR €36 each EXW
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OOM204: 0110047 Oxygen sensor R-47V = EUR €55.20 each EXW

 

We are continually adding sensors to our range, the latest one is for the Maquet Servo s/i ventilators. We offer a large saving on this sensor, if you have any clients using them
I am sure they would be interested.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Thu, 11 Jul 2024 at 13:04, Frederick ELASRI <f.elasri@2mt-medical.com> wrote:

Hello,

 

Would you mind sending me the latest pricelist of O2 cells ?

 

In the mean time could you please let me know the actual delivery delay for OOM-202 and OOM-204 cells type ?

 

Regards,
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Frédérick ELASRI

Ingénieur Biomédical et Directeur

T : 06 07 42 50 62

 

2MT

29, chemin de la Violette

31240 L’UNION

Tel : 05 62 87 54 00 _ Fax : 05 62 87 51 67

Email : contact@2MT-medical.com
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