
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: R17MED
Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 9 July 2024 at 15:57
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we send Yamina a proforma invoice..

Thank you, ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Yamina Duteille Anagaz <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>
Date: Tue, 9 Jul 2024 at 15:36
Subject: RE: R17MED
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: Yamina Duteille Anagaz <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>

Dear Ryan,

 

Could you please provide me your quote with freight and insurance cost for the following parts? Thank you.
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5 sondes télédyne type Cellule % O2 Clase R17Med
1 sonde télédyne type Cellule % O2 Classe T -7

 

Kind regards

 

Yamina Duteille

ANAGAZ

Tél : 06 41 60 35 13

Email : yamina.duteille@anagaz.com

 

 

 

De : Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Envoyé : lundi 24 juin 2024 10:33
À : Yamina Duteille Anagaz <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>
Objet : Re: R17MED

 

Hi Yamina

 

Your order is with our sales office for processing, they will let you know if there is any problem.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
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General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 24 Jun 2024 at 08:59, <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

I attached the PO for 1x R17Med. Could you please ask to ship it today in order to get it before the end of this week ?

I will be on holidays from next Monday,

 

Thank you.

 

Kind regards

 

Bien cordialement,

 

Yamina DUTEILLE

 

ANAGAZ

19 Rue des Sœurs

67400 illkirch graffenstaden
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Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13

Fax : + 00 (33) (0) 1 70 24 73 84

 

 

 

 

De : Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Envoyé : lundi 10 juin 2024 16:55
À : yamina.duteille@anagaz.com
Objet : Re: R17MED

 

Hi Yamina

 

The R-17MED are available via our sister company Viamed:

 

R-17MED - 0110017

Euro, each EXW

1+ = € 45.70,   25+ = € 41.10

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
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http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 10 Jun 2024 at 14:27, <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

Could you please provide me the price with lead time for 1 piece R17Med ?

 

Best regards

 

 

Bien cordialement

 

Yamina DUTEILLE

 

ANAGAZ

19 Rue des Soeurs

67400 ILLKIRCH GRAFFENSTADEN-FRANCE

Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13

Fax : + 00 (33) (0) 1 70 24 73 84
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