
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

FW: FW:
1 message

SIM | Rainbow Runner <simrr@rainbowrunner.net> 9 July 2024 at 03:43
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: cm@rainbowrunner.net, "terrence.ng@rainbowrun…" <terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net>

Hi Ryan

If shipment have yet to be sent, can I request to add 3 pieces of :

R-33DE Oxygen Sensor.

Can I also request , f possible that we pay for these 3 pieces in our next reorder?

 

 

Regards,

Sim

** All information provided is subject to stock availability and prior sales.
** All quotations / deliveries are EX-RAINBOW RUNNER SDN BHD and non-insured unless stated otherwise. Proof of shipment is
considered proof of delivery. We will not be held liable for lost or damaged shipments that occur during transit once leaving our
premises, regardless of the shipping service selected. If you have a preferred shipping service, please let us know.

Rainbow Runner Sdn Bhd

No. 5 , Ukay Boulevard, Jln Lingkaran Tengah Dua, Hulu Kelang, 68000 Ampang, Selangor.
T +603 4162 2837 / 3837   F +603 4161 7837
Website: www.rainbowrunner.net
Facebook: facebook.com/rainbowrunnermy
Instagram: @rainbowrunnermy

*Rainbow Runner reserves the right to change any and all information without prior notice, and to immediate, complete, and
irrevocable effect. For more information, please read our terms and conditions.

 

From: SIM | Rainbow Runner <simrr@rainbowrunner.net>
Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 5:14 PM
To: 'ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk' <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>; 'terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net'
<terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net>
Cc: 'cm@rainbowrunner.net' <cm@rainbowrunner.net>
Subject: RE: FW:

 

Hi Ryan

I await then your tracking number

 

Regards,

Sim

** All information provided is subject to stock availability and prior sales.
** All quotations / deliveries are EX-RAINBOW RUNNER SDN BHD and non-insured unless stated otherwise. Proof of shipment is

09/07/2024, 15:04 Gmail - FW: FW:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1802272471273248642%7Cmsg-f:1804067714833183… 1/5

https://www.google.com/maps/search/Jln+Lingkaran+Tengah+Dua+,++Hulu+Kelang,+68000+Ampang,+Selangor?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Jln+Lingkaran+Tengah+Dua+,++Hulu+Kelang,+68000+Ampang,+Selangor?entry=gmail&source=g
http://rainbowrunner.net/index.php?
https://www.facebook.com/rainbowrunnermy/
https://www.instagram.com/rainbowrunnermy/?hl=en
https://www.rainbowrunner.net/terms-conditions
mailto:simrr@rainbowrunner.net
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net
mailto:terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net
mailto:cm@rainbowrunner.net
mailto:cm@rainbowrunner.net


considered proof of delivery. We will not be held liable for lost or damaged shipments that occur during transit once leaving our
premises, regardless of the shipping service selected. If you have a preferred shipping service, please let us know.

Rainbow Runner Sdn Bhd

No. 5 , Ukay Boulevard, Jln Lingkaran Tengah Dua, Hulu Kelang, 68000 Ampang, Selangor.
T +603 4162 2837 / 3837   F +603 4161 7837
Website: www.rainbowrunner.net
Facebook: facebook.com/rainbowrunnermy
Instagram: @rainbowrunnermy

*Rainbow Runner reserves the right to change any and all information without prior notice, and to immediate, complete, and
irrevocable effect. For more information, please read our terms and conditions.

 

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 4:52 PM
To: terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net
Cc: cm@rainbowrunner.net; SIM | Rainbow Runner <simrr@rainbowrunner.net>
Subject: Re: FW:

 

Thank you Terence

 

We will look out for it.

 

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 1 Jul 2024 at 17:41, <terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

We have made a new transaction due to the previous payment was rejected bank our bank.

Please find the attached payment advise for your reference.

 

Regards

 

Terrence Ng
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From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2024 9:33 PM
To: terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net
Subject: Re: FW:

 

Hi Terrence

 

We have not yet received the payment, but I will keep checking with our bank.

 

I have attached a statement, it appears there is a credit of GBP £3 due to an overpayment.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 24 Jun 2024 at 09:57, <terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

This is Terrence from Rainbow Runner Asia Sdn. Bhd.

Please find the attached payment advise for your reference.

 

Also, if you can refer 19th June 2024’s email that to request for statement as we have made the payment by
using EUR currencies. We would like to check if there is outstanding / overpaid amount for Rainbow Runner
Asia.

 

Regards

 

Terrence Ng
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From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, 24 June, 2024 4:22 PM
To: SIM | Rainbow Runner <simrr@rainbowrunner.net>
Cc: Cm <cm@rainbowrunner.net>; Terrence Ng <terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net>
Subject: Re: FW:

 

Dear Sim

 

We have not received your payment as yet, I expect it will arrive soon.

As soon as we receive it, your order will be processed and you should receive a copy of your invoice and
tracking number shortly after dispatch.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 24 Jun 2024 at 08:15, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SIM | Rainbow Runner <simrr@rainbowrunner.net>
Date: Mon, 24 Jun 2024 at 06:25
Subject: FW:
To: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Cc: <cm@rainbowrunner.net>, <terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net>

Hi Ryan
Pls advise tracking number
Our accounts had also requested statement of accounts.

Regards,
Sim
** All information provided is subject to stock availability and prior
sales.
** All quotations / deliveries are EX-RAINBOW RUNNER SDN BHD and non-insured
unless stated otherwise. Proof of shipment is considered proof of delivery.
We will not be held liable for lost or damaged shipments that occur during
transit once leaving our premises, regardless of the shipping service
selected. If you have a preferred shipping service, please let us know.
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Rainbow Runner Sdn Bhd
No. 5 , Ukay Boulevard, Jln Lingkaran Tengah Dua, Hulu Kelang, 68000 Ampang,
Selangor.
T +603 4162 2837 / 3837   F +603 4161 7837
Website: www.rainbowrunner.net
Facebook: facebook.com/rainbowrunnermy
Instagram: @rainbowrunnermy

*Rainbow Runner reserves the right to change any and all information without
prior notice, and to immediate, complete, and irrevocable effect. For more
information, please read our terms and conditions.

-----Original Message-----
From: SIM | Rainbow Runner <simrr@rainbowrunner.net>
Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2024 12:04 PM
To: 'Ryan Swaine' <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Cc: 'CM' <cm@rainbowrunner.net>; 'terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net'
<terrence.ng@rainbowrunner.net>
Subject: FW:

Hi Ryan
Pls refer attachment of payment
I await your tracking number

Regards,
Sim
** All information provided is subject to stock availability and prior
sales.
** All quotations / deliveries are EX-RAINBOW RUNNER SDN BHD and non-insured
unless stated otherwise. Proof of shipment is considered proof of delivery.
We will not be held liable for lost or damaged shipments that occur during
transit once leaving our premises, regardless of the shipping service
selected. If you have a preferred shipping service, please let us know.

Rainbow Runner Sdn Bhd
No. 5 , Ukay Boulevard, Jln Lingkaran Tengah Dua, Hulu Kelang, 68000 Ampang,
Selangor.
T +603 4162 2837 / 3837   F +603 4161 7837
Website: www.rainbowrunner.net
Facebook: facebook.com/rainbowrunnermy
Instagram: @rainbowrunnermy

*Rainbow Runner reserves the right to change any and all information without
prior notice, and to immediate, complete, and irrevocable effect. For more
information, please read our terms and conditions.

-----Original Message-----
From: Rainbow Runner <rainbowrunnermy@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2024 10:55 AM
To: Yong Sim <simrr@rainbowrunner.net>
Subject:
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