
Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

Vandagraph Invoice RAN150379-1 Reference 06062439ML
J . <jimmywuytack@hotmail.com> 9 July 2024 at 14:07
To: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>, Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear,

 

Our customer is still waiting for this part of the analyser (Quick Ox sampler).

How fast can you send this part to us?

 

Kind regards,

 

Jimmy Wuytack

 

Sidemount Academy           |              https://sidemount-academy.shop   |              TEL: +32 468 13 99 19

Dommelstraat 114, 9250 Waasmunster, BE

 

 

[Quoted text hidden]

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Info Sidemount Academy <info@sidemount-academy.shop>
To: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Bcc: 
Date: Wed, 5 Jun 2024 16:18:37 +0000
Subject: RE: New order 5/06/24

Hi Michael,

 

Ok, you can send the one with the manual switch off, thanks.

 

Kind regards,
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Jimmy Wuytack

 

Sidemount Academy           |              https://sidemount-academy.shop   |              TEL: +32 468 13 99 19

Dommelstraat 114, 9250 Waasmunster, BE

 

 

Van: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>
Verzonden: woensdag 5 juni 2024 17:03
Aan: Info Sidemount Academy <info@sidemount-academy.shop>
CC: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Onderwerp: Re: New order 5/06/24

 

Thank you for your email,

Ryan is away on leave at the moment so I will reply on his behalf.

 

Unfortunately we don't have any stock of the AUTO SWITCH OFF VN202'S , and are unsure when we will be getting
more stock in.

We do however still have stock of the MANUAL SWITCH OFF VN202'S if you would like us to supply you with those?

 

Kind regards

Michael

 

Michael Lamb

Vandagraph Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

 

 

On Wed, 5 Jun 2024 at 15:22, Info Sidemount Academy <info@sidemount-academy.shop> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

I would like to make the following order:

09/07/2024, 15:01 Gmail - Vandagraph Invoice RAN150379-1 Reference 06062439ML

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2233dff547&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1804106924485198598&simpl=msg-f:18041069244851… 2/3

https://sidemount-academy.shop/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Dommelstraat+114,+9250+Waasmunster,+BE?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:info@sidemount-academy.shop


1 x 7910101 - VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (inc. Sensor/Quick-Ox) - Auto switch-off

 

Customer reference: 01042113RS

 

Kind regards,

 

Jimmy Wuytack

 

Sidemount Academy           |              https://sidemount-academy.shop   |              TEL: +32 468 13 99 19

Dommelstraat 114, 9250 Waasmunster, BE
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