6/24/24, 9:46 AM Gmail - Re: Quotation for MAXTEC’s Oxygen sensors

M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Quotation for MAXTEC’s Oxygen sensors

1 message

Supattra Polnikorn <bb_bio_chem2010@yahoo.com> 24 June 2024 at 07:01
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate Griffiths,

Sorry for your inconvenience, I would like to add another 9pcs of MAX-250E, so would you
please send me the quotation for the items as below:

1. MAX-14 (Fluke version), part number: 0110420, 15pcs

2. MAX-250, 4pcs

3. MAX-250+, (Fluke VT900A), part number: 0110427, 10pcs
4. MAX-250E, part number: 0110429, 15pcs

Best regards,
Pongnarin Yoosomboon

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Friday, June 21, 2567, 10:28 PM, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,
Thank you for your order.

| have been unable to complete your proforma invoice as | need the weights and
dimensions from a colleague in order to work out the carriage.

| will email it as soon as | can on Monday.
Thank you for your patience.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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