
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: June Order
1 message

Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch> 7 June 2024 at 17:07
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com>
Cc: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Hi

Payment is sent.

You can update shipping adress :

Me Christophe Zermatten
Rue des Alpes, 15
1201 Geneve
Switzerland
Phone : +41 78 892 95 26

Best regards !

Etienne MENAGER, M.D.

www.air-research.ch

Le mercredi 5 juin 2024 à 16:47, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com> a écrit :

Good afternoon Etienne,

Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days. As you are aware, the lead time is usually 4 - 6
weeks.

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made, eg. addresses.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Vandagraph Sensor Technologies
kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com

VST is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line.
-----------------
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On Wed, 5 Jun 2024 at 15:28, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch>
Date: Wed, 5 Jun 2024 at 14:53
Subject: Re: June Order
To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Thanks !

We can send you payment as soon as we receive the invoice.

Best regards

Etienne MENAGER, M.D.

logoProton.png
www.air-research.ch

Le mercredi 5 juin 2024 à 15:41, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> a écrit :

Apologies Etienne, please find the corrected price list attached.

Regards

Steve

On Wed, 5 Jun 2024 at 13:12, Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch> wrote:
Dear Steve,

Thanks, for fast answer,

So we'll be ordering 15x sensor 8010029

Your price list is ok but our website are www.salamandreccr.ch

Best regards

Etienne MENAGER, M.D.

logoProton.png
www.air-research.ch

Le mercredi 5 juin 2024 à 11:43, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> a
écrit :

Dear Etienne

Can you please switch over and start ordering the Air Research labelled
sensor 8010029. Standard delivery led time is usually 4 - 6 weeks.

Regards

Steve

On Wed, 5 Jun 2024 at 10:01, Air Research <etienne@air-research.ch>
wrote:

Hi Steve,

I hope you are well.
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I would like to know if it is possible to order 15 cells again?
(8010000 Oxygen Sensor - VST2200)

Have some production/delivery date ?

Please let me know if this is possible.

Have a nice weekend,

Best regards

Etienne MENAGER, M.D.

www.air-research.ch

--
Steve
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

--
Steve
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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