
Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: UHD15824 Purchase Order
Legg, Chloe <Chloe.Legg@uhd.nhs.uk> 3 June 2024 at 15:31
To: Sherralee Lamb <sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon Sherralee,

 

Please can UHD15824 be cancelled. Can you let me know once this has been done so I can do the same on our system. It is no longer needed.

 

Thank you.

 

Kind Regards,

 

Chloe Legg | Apprentice Operational Buyer

 

Please see below link regarding off-site venue hire, hospitality and training.

https://intranet.uhd.nhs.uk/index.php/communications/latest-news/2831-financial-update-15-december-2024

 

E-Proc training videos :

https://dorsetnhs.sharepoint.com/:w:/r/teams/PowergateUsers/Shared%20Documents/General/Eprocurement%20Training%20Videos.docx?d=
w0bcab33e00f94fe68097299923265a4b&csf=1&web=1&e=4XBfVd

 

Commercial Services
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FOR HELPFUL POWERGATE TRAINING VIDEOS, PLEASE USE BELOW LINK:

 

https://web.microsoftstream.com/channel/95f90b72-a27f-4534-a629-1928582e48ec

 

     

University Hospitals Dorset

Royal Bournemouth and Christchurch Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

Castle Lane East | Bournemouth | Dorset | BH7 7DW

 

 

Providing commercial, procurement and supply chain services on behalf of University Hospitals Dorset NHS Foundation Trust

 

For all invoice payment queries please use the ‘’Ask ELFS AP Portal’’ which can be found here

From: Sherralee Lamb <sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 2:46 PM
To: Legg, Chloe <Chloe.Legg@uhd.nhs.uk>
Subject: Re: UHD15824 Purchase Order

 

Good Afternoon Chloe,

 

Thank you for your email, If you could let me know as soon as possible please.

 

Kind regards

 

Sherralee Lamb
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: sherralee.lamb@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

 

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 3 Jun 2024 at 13:17, Legg, Chloe <Chloe.Legg@uhd.nhs.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon,
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Apologies for not updating you. I am waiting for a response from our end users regarding if they want to proceed with this order. I will let you know when I
find out.

 

Thank you.

 

Kind Regards,

 

Chloe Legg | Apprentice Operational Buyer

 

Please see below link regarding off-site venue hire, hospitality and training.

https://intranet.uhd.nhs.uk/index.php/communications/latest-news/2831-financial-update-15-december-2024

 

E-Proc training videos :

https://dorsetnhs.sharepoint.com/:w:/r/teams/PowergateUsers/Shared%20Documents/General/Eprocurement%20Training%20Videos.docx?d=
w0bcab33e00f94fe68097299923265a4b&csf=1&web=1&e=4XBfVd

 

Commercial Services
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FOR HELPFUL POWERGATE TRAINING VIDEOS, PLEASE USE BELOW LINK:
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University Hospitals Dorset
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Royal Bournemouth and Christchurch Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

Castle Lane East | Bournemouth | Dorset | BH7 7DW

 

 

Providing commercial, procurement and supply chain services on behalf of University Hospitals Dorset NHS Foundation Trust

 

For all invoice payment queries please use the ‘’Ask ELFS AP Portal’’ which can be found here

From: Sherralee Lamb <sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 12:30 PM
To: Legg, Chloe <Chloe.Legg@uhd.nhs.uk>; Carter, Michael <Michael.Carter@uhd.nhs.uk>; Hornby, Connor <Connor.Hornby@uhd.nhs.uk>
Subject: Re: UHD15824 Purchase Order

 

Good Afternoon,

 

Please read my previous email regarding PO UHD15824,

 

Please let me know if you wish to proceed.

 

 

Kind regards

 

Sherralee Lamb

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk
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Alternate email: sherralee.lamb@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

 

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 20 May 2024 at 15:02, Sherralee Lamb <sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good Afternoon.

 

Thank you for your order UHD15824,
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I'm just emailing to let you know the price on your PO is incorrect.

 

the correct price for 

Posey Sensor Wraps Box of 12 - Model 6554 is the following,

 

All Prices are Excluding VAT.

 

1-2 Packs =
 £ 15.80

2 - 3 Packs =
£ 12.80

3-10 Packs =
 £ 11.80

11+ Packs =
 £ 11.45

 

Please let me know if you would like to proceed with this order.

Kind regards

 

Sherralee Lamb

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: sherralee.lamb@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: sherralee.lamb@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

 

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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