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M Gmall Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: PROFORMA

1 message

Comercial Utilmédica <comercial@utilmedica.pt> 3 June 2024 at 13:52
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Steve Nixon,
for PROFORMA:

UTILMEDICA - PRODUTOS MEDICOS HOSPITALARES, LDA.
RUA JOSE ANTONIO CRUZ, 44

4715-343 BRAGA

Telefone: 253248304

NIF: 506999092

Com os melhores cumprimentos,

Rogeério Ferreira

Departamento de Or¢gamentos
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Utilmeédica - Produtos Médicos Hospitalares, Lda.

E comercial@utilmedica.pt
"= 966 168 559
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Condigcoes Gerais de Venda
IBAN: PT50 0079 0000 1990 9549 10150

A Utilmédica respeita a sua privacidade. Para saber mais sobre a olitica de privacidade da Utilmédica, consulte em
https://utilmedica.pt/politica-de-privacidade.html

De: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Enviada: 3 de junho de 2024 13:14

Para: Comercial Utilmédica <comercial@utilmedica.pt>
Assunto: Re: PROFORMA

Good afternoon Rogerio,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price of part number 0110560 - oxygen sensor OOM111 is €73.95 each EXW. These are currently in
stock.

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, insurance and bank charges, | would need
your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a hew account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 3 Jun 2024 at 11:19, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Comercial Utilmédica <comercial@utilmedica.pt>
Date: Mon, 3 Jun 2024 at 11:14

Subject: PROFORMA

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
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Dear Steve Nixon,

We request a proforma to confirm discounts, delivery times and shipping costs:

-2 UNITS OF O2 SENSOR REF. OOM111 FOR ENVITEC MYSIGN O OXIMETER

Com os melhores cumprimentos,

Rogeério Ferreira

Departamento de Or¢gamentos
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A Utilmédica respeita a sua privacidade. Para saber mais sobre a olitica de privacidade da Utilmédica, consulte em
https://utilmedica.pt/politica-de-privacidade.html
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