
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024
1 message

Dreier, Uwe <uwe.dreier@dilo-gmbh.com> 27 May 2024 at 14:02
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Kate,

 

ok. Please send me a proforma invoice an I will organize the prepaymet with our accounting department.

 

Invoice adress and delivery adress are the same:

 

DILO

Armaturen und Anlagen GmbH

Frundsbergstrasse 36

D-87727 Babenhausen/Bayern

 

Tel: +49 (0) 83 33 - 302-0

E-Mail:info@dilo-gmbh.com

 

For your information

Your Kreditor-Number is: 52751

 

 

 

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Kind regards

Uwe Dreier
Technischer Einkauf / Technical Purchasing

Phone: +49 8333 302-203
Mobile: +49 171 9321986
Fax: +49 8333 302-302
Uwe.Dreier@dilo-gmbh.com
https://www.dilo.eu

     

28/05/2024, 08:51 Gmail - AW: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1799926011554301659%7Cmsg-f:1800211040770846… 1/6

https://www.google.com/maps/search/Frundsbergstrasse+36+D-87727+Babenhausen%2FBayern?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Frundsbergstrasse+36+D-87727+Babenhausen%2FBayern?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:info@dilo-gmbh.com
mailto:Uwe.Dreier@dilo-gmbh.com
https://www.dilo.eu/
https://www.facebook.com/DILOGmbH
https://www.facebook.com/DILOGmbH
https://instagram.com/dilo_worldwide
https://instagram.com/dilo_worldwide
https://www.linkedin.com/company/dilo-armaturen-und-anlagen-gmbh
https://www.linkedin.com/company/dilo-armaturen-und-anlagen-gmbh
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5RO9DmLXf5e_l2m1AXvCzg
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5RO9DmLXf5e_l2m1AXvCzg


Von: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Gesendet: Freitag, 24. Mai 2024 12:28
An: Dreier, Uwe <uwe.dreier@dilo-gmbh.com>
Betreff: Re: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024

 

Good morning Uwe,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

The price of part number 0110117 - oxygen sensor - Automotive R-17A is €48.50 each EXW.  These are currently in
stock.

 

We would require pre-payment.  If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charge and insurance, I would
need your invoice and delivery address to set up a new account for you.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

E-mail Disclaimer
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-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 24 May 2024 at 10:33, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Dreier, Uwe <uwe.dreier@dilo-gmbh.com>
Date: Fri, 24 May 2024 at 09:58
Subject: WG: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024
To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Sir or Madams,

 

please send me an offer for:

 

1pc

R-17A Oxygen Sensor

Part Number: 0110117

 

Is it possible to purchase on account without prepayment?

 

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Kind regards

Uwe Dreier
Technischer Einkauf / Technical Purchasing

Phone: +49 8333 302-203
Mobile: +49 171 9321986
Fax: +49 8333 302-302
Uwe.Dreier@dilo-gmbh.com
https://www.dilo.eu
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Von: Stefanie Evers <stefanie.evers@berntgmbh.de>
Gesendet: Donnerstag, 23. Mai 2024 10:22
An: Dreier, Uwe <uwe.dreier@dilo-gmbh.com>
Cc: Christoph Zellner <christoph.zellner@berntgmbh.de>; Mathias Spreemann <mathias.spreemann@berntgmbh.
de>
Betreff: AW: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024

 

Guten Tag Herr Dreier,

 

leider kann ich Ihnen da nicht mehr helfen.

Die Bestell-Nr. bei Viamed lautet : 0110117.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen

Stefanie Evers

Kaufm. Sachbearbeitung

 

T: +49-211-669-6998-19

E:stefanie.evers@berntgmbh.de

 

Bernt Messtechnik GmbH | Wahlerstraße 12, D-40472 Düsseldorf

 

Sitz der Gesellschaft: Düsseldorf Handelsregister Düsseldorf HRB 19231

Geschäftsführer: Dipl.-Ing. Peter Berg, Dipl.-Ing. Alexander Bernt
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Von: Dreier, Uwe <uwe.dreier@dilo-gmbh.com>
Gesendet: Donnerstag, 23. Mai 2024 08:13
An: Stefanie Evers <stefanie.evers@berntgmbh.de>
Cc: Christoph Zellner <christoph.zellner@berntgmbh.de>; Mathias Spreemann <mathias.spreemann@berntgmbh.
de>
Betreff: AW: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024

 

Guten Morgen Frau Evers,

 

danke für die Rückmeldung.

Können Sie für uns noch die eine „ last order“ beschaffen?

 

Können Sie mir die Artikelnummer des Sensors von VIAMED Ltd   nennen,

damit ich den bei VIAMED anfragen kann?

 

Vielen Dank im Voraus für Ihre Rückmeldung.

 

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Kind regards

Uwe Dreier
Technischer Einkauf / Technical Purchasing

Phone: +49 8333 302-203
Mobile: +49 171 9321986
Fax: +49 8333 302-302
Uwe.Dreier@dilo-gmbh.com
https://www.dilo.eu

     

Von: Stefanie Evers <stefanie.evers@berntgmbh.de>
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 22. Mai 2024 11:30
An: Dreier, Uwe <uwe.dreier@dilo-gmbh.com>
Cc: Christoph Zellner <christoph.zellner@berntgmbh.de>; Mathias Spreemann <mathias.spreemann@berntgmbh.
de>
Betreff: Ihre Bestellung 4500087714 vom 07.05.2024
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Sehr geehrter Herr Dreier,

 

leider können wir Ihren o.g. Auftrag nicht mehr ausführen.

Wir haben den Artikel aus unserem Portfolio herausgenommen, da die Bevorratung aufgrund der äußerst geringen
Verkaufszahlen nicht rentabel ist.

 

Wenden Sie sich bitte bei Bedarf an die Fa. Viamed Ltd. In GB :

 

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen

Stefanie Evers

Kaufm. Sachbearbeitung

 

T: +49-211-669-6998-19

E:stefanie.evers@berntgmbh.de

 

Bernt Messtechnik GmbH | Wahlerstraße 12, D-40472 Düsseldorf

 

Sitz der Gesellschaft: Düsseldorf Handelsregister Düsseldorf HRB 19231

Geschäftsführer: Dipl.-Ing. Peter Berg, Dipl.-Ing. Alexander Bernt

 

 

DILO Armaturen und Anlagen GmbH, HRB Memmingen Nr. 3225
Geschäftsführer: Christian Scheller, Dr. Klaus Jostschulte

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response
deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.
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