
Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Re: SRS68562
chris <chris@thinairsports.com> 22 May 2024 at 14:16
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

please can I order two of these.

thanks
chris

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>
Date: 22/05/2024 14:04 (GMT+00:00)
To: chris@thinairsports.com
Subject: Re: SRS68562

Hello Chris

Good afternoon 

Thank you for your email.

Yes we have them in stock.

Please let me know if I can assist with anything else.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 1/16
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

On Wed, 22 May 2024 at 13:54, <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

Hi Aqib,

Do you have these in stock ? 0014651

 

I just need 3 of them.

 

Thanks

Chris

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: 22 September 2023 13:38
To: chris <chris@thinairsports.com>
Subject: Re: SRS68562

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 2/16
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Hello Chris

 

Yes the payment was received.

 

We will ship your order today.

 

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 3/16
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 22 Sept 2023 at 13:27, chris <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

Hi

 

Did the payment show up in your account? so the parts can be sent out today?

 

thanks

chris

 

 

 

Sent from my Galaxy

 

 

-------- Original message --------

From: Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: 22/09/2023 10:09 (GMT+00:00)

To: chris <chris@thinairsports.com>

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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Subject: Re: SRS68562

 

Hello Chris

 

Good morning

 

Please see attached below your proforma invoice.

 

Can you please check and see all details are correct including addresses.

 

If you wish to proceed please make payment so we can convert this to an order and get it ready for dispatch.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 5/16
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Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 22 Sept 2023 at 09:13, chris <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

ok. email me the cost and I will pay now.

 

 

 

 

Sent from my Galaxy

 

 

-------- Original message --------

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 6/16

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:chris@thinairsports.com


From: Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: 22/09/2023 09:04 (GMT+00:00)

To: chris <chris@thinairsports.com>

Subject: Re: SRS68562

 

Hello Chris

 

Good morning 

 

You will need to make payment before we ship.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 7/16

mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:chris@thinairsports.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd


Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered,
but please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 22 Sept 2023 at 09:02, chris <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

can you get them sent out today please? 

 

 

 

 

Sent from my Galaxy

 

 

-------- Original message --------

From: Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 8/16
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Date: 22/09/2023 09:01 (GMT+00:00)

To: chris@thinairsports.com

Subject: Re: SRS68562

 

Hello 

 

Good morning 

 

Yes, we have plenty of them in stock

 

I will send you a proforma invoice soon.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 9/16
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Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 22 Sept 2023 at 08:51, <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

Hi,

 

0014754

Is the correct one?  Medium size?

 

Chris

 

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: 22 September 2023 08:47
To: chris@thinairsports.com
Subject: Re: SRS68562

 

Hello Chris

 

Good morning 

 

Can you please state the part number you require please.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:chris@thinairsports.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd


Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 22 Sept 2023 at 08:44, <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

HI Aqib,

 

Do you have any soft medium sensors in stock?  The ones I usually order?

 

If you do please can I order 5.

 

Thanks

Chris

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: 06 September 2023 09:07
To: chris@thinairsports.com
Subject: Re: SRS68562

 

Hello Chris 

Good morning 

I am very sorry to hear that but like I said yesterday according to our returns we have not had a single report of a failed spring on these.

 

Please let me know if I can assist with anything else.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, 5 Sept 2023 at 17:10, <chris@thinairsports.com> wrote:

Thanks for this.

Just to let you know this is the 4th one that I had issues with, Viamed has already repaired one for me last year. This one will be the second and the other two
were out of warranty.

 

Thanks

Chris

 

 

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: 05 September 2023 17:03
To: chris@thinairsports.com
Subject: SRS68562

 

The address to return it to is as follows:

 

Viamed Ltd

Repairs Team SRS68562

15 Station Road
Cross Hills
Keighley

West Yorkshire
BD20 7DT

UK

 

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

22/05/2024, 14:22 Gmail - Re: SRS68562

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799758885452588479&simpl=msg-f:1799758885452588479&mb=1 16/16

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy

