
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Sensor for VN202.mkII
1 message

John Garvin <johngarvin@me.com> 21 May 2024 at 10:36
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Thanks, Ryan. 
UPS please. 
Thanks
John
Sent from my iPhone

On 21 May 2024, at 7:00 PM, Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi John

Thank you very much for your email.

Please find a proforma invoice attached. 
I have added the transport by Airmail which I expect could take a while to reach New Zealand. We can
upgrade this to UPS, which would be much quicker, the cost for that would be an additional GBP £20

Please let me know if you require the transport amending or if you are happy to proceed and I will send
you a payment link where you can make a card payment.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 21 May 2024 at 09:27, John Garvin <johngarvin@me.com> wrote:
Hi
John Garvin checking in. 
I need a replacement sensor for the VN202 mkII. Can pay via credit card or paypal. 

Shipped to:

John Garvin
CORAL  DIVE DEPT
880 Productions NZ Limited Partnership
PO Box 15 472, Miramar 6243, Wellington, NZ

Thanks!

John

Sent from my iPhone
<MAN150065.pdf>
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