5/20/24, 8:20 AM Gmail - Re: Order VANWEB2178 confirmed

M G ma|l Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Re: Order VANWEB2178 confirmed

1 message

Rohan Holt <rohan@cloudbasepro.co.uk> 19 May 2024 at 16:58
To: Vandagraph <info@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear all at Vandagraph.
Just made the payment below but it's automatically being sent to my old address.

Please could you post to 4 Rowantree Cottages, Clachan Seil, Oban PA344TP
(I think you’ve already posted previously to this one)

Many thanks
Rohan Holt

On Sun, 19 May 2024 at 16:52, Vandagraph <store+56092491969@t.shopifyemail.com> wrote:

) VANDAGRAPH LTD .25

Thank you for your purchase!

Hi Rohan, we're getting your order ready to be shipped. We will notify you
when it has been sent. We shall be in touch should there be any issues with
stock availability.

or Visit our store

Order summary

DIN-22F Pressure Restrictor (9711006) x 1 £18.50

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1799497315102932103%7Cmsg-f:1799497315102932103... 1/2



5/20/24, 8:20 AM

Customer information

Shipping address

Rohan Holt

Tan Hwfa

Bangor LL57 3LA
United Kingdom

Shipping method
Standard

Gmail - Re: Order VANWEB2178 confirmed

Subtotal £18.50
Shipping £7.00
Taxes £5.10

Total £30.60 GBP

Billing address

Rohan Holt

Tan Hwfa

Bangor LL57 3LA
United Kingdom

Payment method

VISA  ending with 2011

If you have any questions, reply to this email or contact us at info@vandagraph.co.uk

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1799497315102932103%7Cmsg-f:1799497315102932103...
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