17/05/2024, 10:44 Gmail - Fwd: Oxygen Sensor - Invoice

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen Sensor - Invoice

Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 17 May 2024 at 10:15
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we send Syed at Avens (CID21029) a proforma invoice for the following items:

R-26Med - 1 qty
Max250A ( R125P04001 ) — 1qty

R41V — 1qty
Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Date: Fri, 17 May 2024 at 09:47

Subject: Re: Oxygen Sensor - Invoice

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Noor <noor@avens.ae>

Yes. Kindly proceed with the invoice.

Thanks

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1799290721131907587 &simpl=msg-f: 1799290721131907587&mb=1 1/4
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From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, May 17, 2024 12:44:53 PM

To: Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Subject: Re: Oxygen Sensor - Invoice

Hi Syed
There is no expiry date.
Should we send you the proforma invoice?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 17 May 2024 at 09:43, Ali <Director@avens.ae> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Thanks for your quick reply.
| wanted to know whether any expiry date is mentioned on this max250A oxygen sensor ?

Because customer won’t accept the oxygen sensor if its near date of expiry.

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Date: Friday, 17 May 2024 at 12:34 PM

To: Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Subject: Re: Oxygen Sensor - Invoice
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Hi Syed

Before we send you a proforma invoice, please note that our current stock of MAX-250A were manufactured May/2023.

Please note that it takes 6 weeks or more to get them from the USA and they can be up to a year old when we receive them from the manufacturer. So it is important to focus
on the warranty period, not the manufacture date.

We have been supplying the MAX-250A for over 20 years and so far we have not had a single reported problem.

Please let me know how you would like to proceed.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 17 May 2024 at 09:07, Ali <Director@avens.ae> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Greetings
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Kindly share me the invoice for the below item.

1. R-26Med - 1 qty
2. Max250A ( R125P04001 ) — 1qty
3. R41V - 1qty

Regarding the item 2, requesting to provide the latest manufacturing date like 1 month from the manufacturing date ( Manufacturing Date ; April 2024 )

Thanks and regards

Syed Ali

Managing Director

AVENS 9 office. No: 1507

MEDICAL SUPPLIES

SIT Tower, Dubai Silicon QOasis

Dubai - United Arab Emirates
+971563356076

+9714591 81 83

director@avens.ae; www.avensmed.com
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