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M G ma|l Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
RE: Trade account

1 message

Matthew S. Eker <matt@diveguernsey.co.uk> 14 May 2024 at 21:07

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan.

Please can | have:

2 x 0110224 R-33DE (Analox O2EIl, O2EIl Pro, 9100-9220-9B)

I'll need some analysers soon too, but these will have to wait for a time when | have better cash flow.

Can these be sent to my home address. I’'m not yet back to normal shop hours yet due to remnants of illness.

Mr Matthew Eker
Notre Maison

No:5 Molineaux Court
Braye Road

Vale

Guernsey

GY3 5PQ

BACS payment is fine, please forward the invoice / details. Is there another email address that | should be using
for orders?

Thanks

Matt

From: Ryan Swaine [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2024 09:46

To: Matthew S. Eker

Subject: Re: Trade account
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Hi Matt

It is nice to hear from you, it has been a long time.

We didn't have you set up on our new system, but | have rectified that.

Please find our pricing and some product information attached.

You are free to place an order whenever you are ready.

There is no minimum order requirement, but we would ask for prepayment, this can be done by bank transfer or | can
send you a payment link for card payments.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 8 May 2024 at 22:29, Matthew S. Eker <matt@diveguernsey.co.uk> wrote:

Hi,

Do we still have a trade account with you? | know it's quite a while since we’ve ordered from Vandagraph.

Thanks

Matt

Matthew S. Eker
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SS1 78787 - PSAI 2106

ASSET T833 - Mares Lab - Apeks - Poseidon
Dive Guernsey

Castle Emplacement

St Peter Port

Guernsey

GY1 1AU

Find us on Facebook or Instagram @diveguernsey
www.diveguernsey.co.uk

Check out our Youtube channel

Mob +44(0)7781 115463 (Text Only)

Map - http://g.co/maps/efv7m
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