
Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Fwd: QUOTE
Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 13 May 2024 at 16:58
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: ANA HERNANDEZ <prindugasana@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 13 May 2024 at 16:55
Subject: Re: QUOTE
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Janine

I need a quote for 50 pieces please

Thanks 

El vie, 10 may 2024 a la(s) 3:21 a.m., Janine Gill (janine.gill@viamed.co.uk) escribió:
Hi Ana,

Thank you for your email.

The price breaks for part number 0110121 - R-21A are as follows:

1-24 = $ 30.90 each EXW 25 or more = $ 27.80 each EXW

Please could you let me know which quantity - 50 or 100 you require for the proforma invoice?

I can then advise you about availability

Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
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Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, 10 May 2024 at 08:42, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: ANA HERNANDEZ <prindugasana@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 9 May 2024 at 17:31
Subject: QUOTE
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Cintia Olivia Enciso Arauzo <enciciara@icloud.com>

Dear Kate,

 I hope you are very well, I send you a cordial greeting and I would like to request your support to quote 50 Automotive Oxygen Sensor R-21A., I also hope you can
support me with the delivery date please. 

Thanks for your help
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