07/05/2024, 16:59 Gmail - Re: Sensor Order

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Sensor Order
1 message

Damien MACDONALD <damien@dmdconcepts.com.au>
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk” <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,
Can | please order another 10 sensor with shipping to Australia. Please send invoice and | will make payment.

Also | have had a sensor come back that was just under 12months old that is faulty, is there anything we can do there?

From: Damien MACDONALD

Sent: Monday, April 8, 2024 10:19:11 PM

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Sensor Order

Thank you, payment has been made
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Done 8 commbank.com.au AA

International money transfers

Transferred $965.74 to
Vandagraph Ltd

GB45BUKB20784290903124

Status @

Submitted

Receipt no.
K034099168943
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Transaction date & time
Mon 08 Apr 2024, 10:18 pm (Syd/Melb time)

From
DMD Concepts 063-527 1066 1494

Exchange rate
1 AUD = 0.4991 GBP

Amount

- — A o o — — -

< (h

Sent from my iPhone

On 8 Apr 2024, at 10:15 pm, Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Damien
Thank you, please find your amended invoice attached.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 4 Apr 2024 at 23:11, Damien MACDONALD <damien@dmdconcepts.com.au> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

Thanks for sending through, can we please revise the qty to 9, ideally to avoids additional customs charges | need to keep under AUD $1000

Regards

Damien MacDonald
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From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2024 10:28 PM

To: Damien MACDONALD <damien@dmdconcepts.com.au>
Subject: Re: Sensor Order

Thank you Damien

Please find your proforma invoice attached.

| will arrange the sensors for testing.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 4 Apr 2024 at 01:46, Damien MACDONALD <damien@dmdconcepts.com.au> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

Can | please order another batch of sensors. Please send through the quote. 12 R-33S1 sensor with shipping to Australia.

Regards

Damien MacDonald
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