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M G ma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
NEW PO

1 message

yamina.duteille@anagaz.com <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> 6 May 2024 at 09:50

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Dear Ryan,

| attached a PO for 6x R33S51 to be shipped ASAP. Please confirm.

Kind regards

Yamina

Bien cordialement

Yamina DUTEILLE

ANAGAZ

19 Rue des Soeurs

67400 ILLKIRCH GRAFFENSTADEN-FRANCE
Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13

Fax : + 00 (33) (0) 1 70 24 73 84

De : Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Envoyé : mercredi 24 avril 2024 16:30

A : yamina.duteille@anagaz.com

Objet : Re: NEW PO

Hi Yamina

Please find the invoice attached.
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Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 24 Apr 2024 at 14:55, <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Could please ask to provide me your invoice of PO attached, Delivery notre DAN149247-10F &-APR 2024 ?

THANK YOU

Kind regards

Yamina

Bien cordialement

Yamina DUTEILLE

ANAGAZ

19 Rue des Soeurs

67400 ILLKIRCH GRAFFENSTADEN-FRANCE

Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13

Fax :+00(33)(0) 1702473 84
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De : Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Envoyé : jeudi 18 avril 2024 12:07

A : yamina.duteille@anagaz.com

Objet : Re: NEW PO

Hi Yamina

The warranty is the same regardless of the manufacture dates.

12 months from the date of invoice.

Because of the issues with supply from Teledyne, we have to plan ahead which does mean that we may have
longer dates than previously.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 18 Apr 2024 at 10:46, <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

| received the 4 SENSORS |, they are built in May 2023, almost 1 year. There is no issue with ? and what about
the warranty?

The customer requires new sensors as per order to avoid any issue for them

Please let me know

Best regards

Yamina
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Bien cordialement

Yamina DUTEILLE

ANAGAZ

19 Rue des Soeurs

67400 ILLKIRCH GRAFFENSTADEN-FRANCE
Tél: + 00 (33) (0) 6 41603513

Fax :+ 00 (33) (0) 17024 73 84

————— Message d'origine-----
De : yamina.duteille@anagaz.com <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>
Envoyé : vendredi 22 mars 2024 11:09

A :'ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk' <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Objet : NEW PO

Dear Ryan,

| need to order 4x R33S1 but need them only on 20th of April. Do you have them? Did i need to place the PO
now?

Best regards

Yamina

Bien cordialement

Yamina DUTEILLE

ANAGAZ

19 Rue des Soeurs

67400 ILLKIRCH GRAFFENSTADEN-FRANCE
Tél: + 00 (33) (0) 6 41603513

Fax:+ 00 (33)(0) 170247384
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De : Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> Envoyé : jeudi 13 novembre 2014 17:38 A :
'lean@vandagraph.co.uk' <jean@vandagraph.co.uk>; 'ryan.swaine@yvandagraph.co.uk'
<ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> Cc : 'Ruth Hardaker' <ruth.hardaker@viamed.co.uk> Objet : R-33S1
Importance : Haute

Dear Jean, Ryan,

Could you please confirm the price for each R-33S1, i need quantity = 6 With the cost for shipment and delivery
time

Thanks iin advance

Best regards

Yamina

De : Ruth Hardaker [mailto:ruth.hardaker@viamed.co.uk]
Envoyé : mardi 21 octobre 2014 12:38
A : Yamina Duteille

Objet : re[2]: Proforma Invoice

Dear Yamina,

We have this sensor in stock at the moment.

If you have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards,

Ruth Hardaker
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email ruth.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

FROM:  Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> (By way of info@viamed.co.uk)

TO: RUTH (Ruth Hardaker) <GoldMine User>

DATE:  Tue, 21 Oct 2014 11:37:47 +0100

SUBJECT: RE: Proforma Invoice

Dear Ruth,

Terms of payment : fully in adavance, means at time you have the sensor ready for shipment?

Thanks for your return

Regards

Yamina

De : Ruth Hardaker [mailto:ruth.hardaker@viamed.co.uk]
Envoyé : mardi 21 octobre 2014 11:56

A : Yamina Duteille
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Objet : Proforma Invoice

Dear Yamina,

Please find attached our proforma invoice as requested.

If you have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards,

Ruth Hardaker
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email ruth.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Sent via Goldmine]

Ce courrier électronique ne contient aucun virus ou logiciel malveillant parce que la protection avast! Antivirus
est active.

http://www.avast.com

This message has been scanned for malware.
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