23/04/2024, 10:53 Gmail - Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899

M G ma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899

1 message

Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se> 23 April 2024 at 10:42

To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,
You can proceed the order.
Best Regards,

Anna Carlin

Category Buyer

JJswevet

Direkt +46 724-02 75 83
Vixel +46 771-21 55 00
Swevet AB

Forskaregatan 1D

SE-275 37 SUOBO, SWEDEN
Org.nr 556621-5843

www.swevet.se

Fran: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Skickat: den 23 april 2024 11:40

Till: Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se>
Amne: Re: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899

Good morning Anna,
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Gmail - Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899

Thank your your order.

Please see below a snip of your order, if you are happy with it, please let me know and | will make it a confirmed

order. As usual, carriage will be added at time of invoice.

Swevel - AB
Forskaregaten 10

Sjoba
2% 37
Sweden

Swevel - AB

Forskaregaten 10 Account 00006308
Sjobo Customer Reference 447899
Date 23 Apr 2024

27537
Swe

den
eori SES56255504401 VAT SE558621584301 Priority 8

Priced In Euros

Order Confirmation CVM149534 Page 1

CIP Carriage and Insurance Paid To Swevet - AB, Sweden * Incoterms(R) 2020

Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Item Reference

0110017
Tariff 901920000
CoO United States

0012176
Tariff 9018199000
CoO Germany

0015002
Tariff 9018199000
CoO E.U.

0025011
Tariff 90181990-00
CoO China

0015000
Tariff 9018185000
CoO E.U.

INS

PPUPSE

Banking datails
Bank

Description Quantity  Unit Unit Vat
Teledyne Sensor R-17MED 4 45.70

Viamed Hand Held Pulse Oximeter VM-2160
Veterinary

Scandinavian language pack

Also includes sensor as detailed below.

Pulse Oximetry ¥ Sensor - Veterinary
Cable Length: 2.0m

Pulse Oximetry Ear Clip/Lingual Clip (M)
Pulse Oximetry Lingual Sensor
Insurance

UPS Courier Delivery - Standard

s Total Net:
Barclays Bank Total Vat:
20-78-42

7309700 Total:

All items are currently in stock.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535

635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1797115517188631375%7Cmsg-f:1797118114840971...
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6523.80
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23/04/2024, 10:53 Gmail - Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 23 Apr 2024 at 10:01, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Tuesday, Wednesday and Thursday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be

answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be

unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
________________ v
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23/04/2024, 10:53 Gmail - Sv: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Apr 23, 2024 at 8:14 AM

Subject: Fwd: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Anna Carlin <anna.carlin@swevet.se>
Date: Tue, 23 Apr 2024 at 07:08

Subject: Swevet AB - Purchase Order 447899
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,
Here comes a purchase order from Swevet. Please send an orderconfirmation.
Best Regards,

Anna Carlin

Category Buyer

Direkt +46 724-02 75 83
Vixel +46 771-21 55 00
Swevet AB

Forskaregatan 1D

SE-275 37 SJOBO, SWEDEN
Org.nr 556621-5843
www.swevet.se
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