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Neomask Phototherapy masks new order
1 message

Sylvie Virapin <sylvie.virapin@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr> 19 April 2024 at 09:27
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,
Sorry again. Yes | accept.

Kind regards
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De : Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Envoyé : vendredi 19 avril 2024 10:19

A : Sylvie Virapin <sylvie.virapin@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr>
Objet : Re: Neomask Phototherapy masks new order

Good morning Sylvie,

Thank you for your email and order. Please could | ask if you accept the prices below for this order?
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Priced In

Order Confirmation CVM149471

US Dollars

Page
CIP Carriage and Insurance Paid To Brand Medical Diffusion, France * Inw!erms(R) 2020

Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Item Reference Description Quantity
1114005 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Regular 20
Tariff 8018199000
CoO United States ~ Ref- R300P01
Pack of 20
1114006 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Premie 10
Tariff 9018199000
CoO USA Ref. R300P02
Pack of 20
1114007 EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask - Micro 5
Tariff 9018199000
Co0 USA. Rel. R300P03
Pack of 20
Bank Charges Bank Charges 1
INS Insurance 1
PPUPSE UPS Courier Delivery - Standard 1

Carriage will be added at time of invoice as usual.

Regarding your previous order CF00000233, as | mentioned in another email, we expect stock of the Neomasks
(1114016) to become available early May. We will of course ship as soon as stock is available.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Unit
50.80

50.80

50.80

20.00

17.78

0.00

Unit Vat Total

1,016.00

508.00

254.00

20.00

17.78

0.00

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 19 Apr 2024 at 08:43, Sylvie Virapin <sylvie.virapin@brandmedicaldiffusion.fr> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Could you please confirm on when we can expect the delivery of the NEOMASK masks ? We urgently
need them (Ref. our PO CF00000233).

Furthermore, please find hereafter our new order for the EYEMAX 2 masks. Please provide the goods
as soon as possible as it is urgent as well.

Many thanks for your feedback

Kind regards
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