4/8/24, 11:10 AM Gmail - RE: 000439453 / 001

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: 000439453 / 001

1 message

Banahan Shirley (Childrens Hospital) <Shirley.Banahan@nuh.nhs.uk> 8 April 2024 at 11:02
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Morning

I’m so sorry as | must have missed this. Yes please we will pay the carriage charge and again, urgently
require these items.

Many thanks
Kind regards

Shirley

From: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Sent: 08 April 2024 10:00

To: procurementbuyingteam <procurementbuyingteam@nuh.nhs.uk>; Banahan Shirley (Childrens
Hospital) <Shirley.Banahan@nuh.nhs.uk>; Beales David (Finance & Procurement)
<David.Beales@nuh.nhs.uk>

Subject: Fwd: 000439453 / 001

This message originated from outside of NUH. Please do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognise the sender and know that the content is safe.

Good morning,
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Thank you for your email.

My colleague Sophie Lines emailed on March 27th to ask if the carriage charge of £10 is accepted fort PO
201211231. If this is accepted, | can proceed. | do not need an amended PO.

If it helps, would you like us to add a memo to show a maximum charge of £12 is accepted for carriage on your
orders?

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 8 Apr 2024 at 09:52

Subject: Fwd: 000439453 / 001

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: David Beales <procurementbuyingteam@nuh.nhs.uk>
Date: Mon, 8 Apr 2024 at 09:44

Subject: Fwd: 000439453 / 001

To: <sales@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: <shirley.banahan@nuh.nhs.uk>

Please take a look at ticket #575539 raised by Banahan Shirley (Childrens Hospital)
(shirley.banahan@nuh.nhs.uk).

https://financesupport.nuh.nhs.uk/helpdesk/tickets/575539

To whom it may concern,

Please can you provide me with a delivery date on the attached order as this is now urgent for the trust.

Kind Regards,
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| [Error! Filename not specified.

On Fri, 5 Apr at 5:48 PM , Banahan Shirley (Childrens Hospital) <shirley.banahan@nuh.nhs.uk>
wrote:

Good afternoon

We ordered infant eye masks some time ago, and they still haven’t arrived. The item is needed as
a matter of high importance. Looking on Integra, we should have received these end of March.

Please could you very kindly provide an update on this?

Many thanks

Kind regards

Shirley

Shirley Banahan
Ward Administrator/PA
Children’s Assessment Unit/E37 Ward

Nottingham Children’s Hospital

Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust

Queen's Medical Centre
Nottingham

NG7 2UH
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Phone: 0115 9249924 x 87691

Email: shirley.banahan@nuh.nhs.uk
Website: www.nuh.nhs.uk
Twitter: @nottmchildrens

Facebook: nottinghamhospitals

The information contained in this email may be the subject of public disclosure
under the

Freedom of Information Act 2000 - unless legally exempt from disclosure, the

confidentiality of this email and your reply cannot be guaranteed.

Copyright of this email and any attachments created by us remains vested in the

Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust.

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely
for

the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.

This footnote also confirms that this email message has been swept by

anti-virus software for the presence of known computer viruses.

Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust
City Hospital campus | Hucknall Road | Nottingham | NG5 1PB | Tel: 0115 969 1169

QMC campus | Derby Road | Nottingham | NG7 2UH | Tel: @115 924 9924
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If you have received this email in error please notify the sender.

Tracking ID: 571f3842-4d88-4113-ba34-30b4b4fe485d

Date and Time : Mon Apr 8 08:44:48 2024
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