05/04/2024, 14:07

M Gmail

Fwd: Mindray Wato 65 pro

1 message

Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk

Gmail - Fwd: Mindray Wato 65 pro

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

5 April 2024 at 12:42

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we process the order as below.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs>
Date: Fri, 5 Apr 2024 at 13:10

Subject: RE: Mindray Wato 65 pro

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Yes please | am sending revised order than

Please find below our new order.

04.04.2024.

Order for Invoice no 1 -

REF Item Quantity pcs
1 110502 | MOX2 2
2 110023 | O2 sensor R23V 10
Order for Invoice no 2 - Pack of 20
1 1114015 | NeoMask size L 20
1 1114016 | NeoMask size M 10

Srdacan pozdrav/Kind regards
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From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: petak, 05. april 2024. 10:27

To: jelena@medisal.co.rs

Subject: Re: Mindray Wato 65 pro

Hi Jelena

The connector on the original sensor is the same as the R-17MED, but the sensor in your picture has a hexagonal top which
makes it easier to grip when fitting and removing from the sensor housing. The original sensor is a MOX2 and | am pleased to
inform you that we can now supply the MOX sensors:

MOX2 - pn. 0110502 = USD $62.50 each EXW

Do you want to add any of the Maquet or MOX2 sensors to your order?

| will await your reply.
Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 5 Apr 2024 at 07:41, Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

My colleague try R17 but doesn’t work because connector is not ok. Please find attached an original.

Please find below our new order.
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04.04.2024.

Order for Invoice no 1 -

Gmail - Fwd: Mindray Wato 65 pro

REF Item Quantity pcs
1 110017 | O2 sensor R-17Vi 2
2 110023 | O2 sensor R23V 10
Order for Invoice no 2 - Pack of 20
1 1114015 | NeoMask size L 20
1 1114016 | NeoMask size M 10

Srdacan pozdrav/Kind regards

Jelena Doderovi¢

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: ¢etvrtak, 04. april 2024. 10:37

To: jelena@medisal.co.rs

Cc: Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Mindray Wato 65 pro

Hi Jelena

We normally supply the R-17MED for use with the Wato 65, the R-17Vi has a similar output but it has a slower response time

and it has a narrower diameter.

R-17MED - 0110017 = USD $ 47.90 (25+ = $ 43.10)
R-17Vi- 0110019 = USD $32.50

The above mentioned sensors are available from stock.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk
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Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 4 Apr 2024 at 09:08, Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs> wrote:

Dear Janine and Ryan

Please confirm me sensor for Mindray Wato 65 Pro is R-17Vi? And do you have on stock?

Srdacan pozdrav/Kind regards

Jelena Doderovié

A o,
MediSal{ X}
-

MEDISAL d.o.o.

Sretenjska 29

11272 Beograd (Dobanovci), Srbija
Tel: + 381 11 7841 474

Tel: +381 11 78 72 373
Mob: +381 69 36 76 204

Fax: +381 11 7841 474

jelena@medisal.co.rs

www.medisal.co.rs
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