04/04/2024, 14:18 Gmail - RE: order

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
RE: order

1 message

David de las Heras | DE PROFUNDIS <david@deprofundis.es> 4 April 2024 at 14:13

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,

Feel free to add another anylizer and resend me the PI, so we’ll arrange the transfer.

We'll pay by card.

Best regards,

David

De: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Enviado el: jueves, 4 de abril de 2024 14:01

Para: David de las Heras | DE PROFUNDIS <david@deprofundis.es>
Asunto: Re: order

Hi David

Thank you very much for your order.
Please find your proforma invoice attached.

Just for your information, there is a better price on the TEK-OX if you purchase 2 or more, | have attached our latest
trade price list for your reference.

If you would like to pay by card, | can send you a payment link or you can make your payment using the bank details
on the invoice.

Thank you and best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1795393064026984574%7Cmsg-f:1795410071431540...
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04/04/2024, 14:18 Gmail - RE: order

On Thu, 4 Apr 2024 at 09:44, David de las Heras | DE PROFUNDIS <david@deprofundis.es> wrote:

Hi guys,

I need the following materials:

2*VAN-0110217 SENSOR R17-VAN
1*VAN7910201 TEK-OX

Can you please send us proforma for the payment?

Thanks in advance,

DAVID DE LAS HERAS

CEO / GENERAL MANAGER

SDI/TDI TECH & CAVE INSTRUCTOR TRAINER
Oficina Regional SDI, TDI & ERDI en Espaiia

soiZA T kol PR Qe

Castellgali 22 | 08295 St. Viceng de Castellet | BARCELONA | +34 93 594 20 91

WEB TIENDA ON-LINE DESCARGA CATALOGO

AVISO DE CONFIDENCIALIDAD: Este mensaje y sus archivos van dirigidos exclusivamente a su destinatario, pudiendo contener informacién confidencial
sometida a secreto profesional. No esta permitida su reproduccion o distribucién sin la autorizacion expresa de DE PROFUNDIS, S.L. Si usted no es el
destinatario final por favor eliminelo e informenos por esta via. De acuerdo con lo establecido en el Reglamento General de Proteccion de Datos (UE) 2016/679
del Parlamento Europeo y del Consejo de 27 de abril de 2016, le informamos que sus datos seran tratados con la finalidad de realizar la gestiéon ofertada por
DE PROFUNDIS, S.L. Asimismo, le informamos la posibilidad de ejercer los derechos de acceso, rectificacion, oposicion, supresion, limitaciéon y portabilidad de
sus datos ante DE PROFUNDIS, S.L.: C/ CASTELLGALI, 22 SANT VICENC DE CASTELLET, Barcelona. Si usted no desea recibir nuestra informacion,
péngase en contacto con nosotros enviando un correo electrénico a la siguiente direccion: comercial@deprofundis.es

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1795393064026984574%7Cmsg-f:1795410071431540...  2/2


mailto:david@deprofundis.es
https://deprofundis.es/
https://shop.deprofundis.es/es/
https://deprofundis.es/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/CATALEG_2024-1.pdf
https://www.google.com/maps/search/C%2F+CASTELLGALI,+22+SANT+VICEN%C3%87+DE+CASTELLET,+Barcelona?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:comercial@deprofundis.es

