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M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: VIAMED/QUOTATION

2 messages

Shirland Trading <shirlandtrading@gmail.com> 27 March 2024 at 10:06
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good Morning Kate,

Thank you for your prompt reply and the quotation.

The invoice address is under my signature, but the delivery address is fine®
If it is an urgent request how long will it take to arrive please?
Many thanks,

Sue

Shirland General Trading LTD
First Floor

182-184 Edgware Road

W2 2DS

London

On Wed, 27 Mar 2024, 10:03 Kate Griffiths, <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Sue,
Thank you for your email.

Please see attached quotation as requested. In order to advise you about stock availability, please
could | ask when you would need these sensors for, should you proceed?

| have used the addresses from your previous orders but can of course make any changes required.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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