3/25/24, 1:07 PM Gmail - Re: Order Oxyquant S

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order Oxyquant S

1 message

Weinkellerei Paul Gasser AG <info@weinkellerei.ch> 25 March 2024 at 13:03
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Kate,
Thanks for the quick answer.

So | would like to order one or two of them. Depends a bit on shipping cost. If it is quite cheap, than | would take one and
reorder later, if shipping is expensive, | would like to order directly 2 of them.

Shipping and billing:
Weinkellerei Paul Gasser AG
Schiitzenhausstrasse 7
8548 Ellikon a. d. Thur
Switzerland

| guess you want prepayment for shipping outside UK so | would like a proforma invoice for it. Euro is fine.

Thanks and best regards
Urs Gasser

Weinkellerei Paul Gasser AG
Schiitzenhausstrasse 7

8548 Ellikon a. d. Thur

Tel 052 375 25 00 | Fax 052 375 24 94

Am 25.03.2024 um 11:02 schrieb Kate Giriffiths:
Good morning Urs,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price of part number 0111275 - oxygen analyser OxiQuant S is €168 each EXW. These are currently in stock. (I
have given the price in euros, but | can use USD if you prefer).

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges and insurance. | would need your
delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy <http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy>

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 24 Mar 2024 at 13:27, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com <mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com>> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: *Weinkellerei Paul Gasser AG* <info@weinkellerei.ch
<mailto:info@weinkellerei.ch>>

Date: Sat, 23 Mar 2024 at 10:00

Subject: Order Oxyquant S

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk <mailto:orders@viamed.co.uk>>

Dear Sir or Madam,

As we can not find this product anymore in Switzerland, | would like to
order a spare part from you.

Art: Envitec OxiQuant S Oxygen Analyser
Part Number: 0111275

Thanks for a quote with Shipping.

Best regards
Urs Gasser

Weinkellerei Paul Gasser AG
Schiitzenhausstrasse 7
8548 Ellikon a. d. Thur

Tel 052 375 25 00 | Fax 052 375 24 94
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