14/03/2024, 08:58 Gmail - Re: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

1 message
Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 14 March 2024 at 08:54
To: office3@ineg-global.com
Bcc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Good morning Andrew,
Thank you for your reply.
In order to give carriage charges | need to issue a quotation or proforma invoice.
I will send you an official quotation for 2 x 0110122 (R-22A) later today. | will use the following for the delivery address:
iNEQ-global
clo Easy Speed International Logistics GmbH
Frankfurter Str. 83
Raunheim
Germany
65479
and the following for the invoice address:
iNEQ-global
Mergenthalerallee 45
Eschborn
Germany
65760
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue
to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 14 Mar 2024 at 07:11, <office3@ineg-global.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please update the prices and time of delivery and please let me know the carriage charges.

Look forward to your favourable reply. Thank you.

Mit freundlichen GriiRen

Best regards

Andrew Darren

E-mail: office3@INEQ-global.com / A.Darren@outlook.com

Skype: iNEQ-global &Mamber.of NEQ)

Instrument & Equipment Specialties GmbH.
HRB 101267 Warenhaus / Warehouse:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1788159121035433539%7Cmsg-a:r-86873643090937...  1/4
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14/03/2024, 08:58 Gmail - Re: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

USt / VAT Nr.: DE298540110 c/o Easy Speed International Logistics GmbH, Frankfurter Str. 83, 65479 Raunheim, Germany

EORI: DE405467942373828 Rechnungsanschrift / Invoice Address: Mergenthalerallee 45, 65760 Eschborn, Germany

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, January 15, 2024 9:15 PM

To: office3@ineg-global.com; a.darren@outlook.com

Subject: Re: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

Good afternoon Darren,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price of part number 0110122 - R-22A is €37.90 each EXW. We can also offer part number 0110182 - R-22AVG which an equivalent sensor and costs €34.15 each
EXW. Both of these sensors are currently in stock.

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges and insurance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 15 Jan 2024 at 12:23, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <office3@ineqg-global.com>
Date: Mon, 15 Jan 2024 at 12:21
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14/03/2024, 08:58

Subject: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

To: <'info@viamed.co.uk"™>

Dear Sir or Madam,

Look forward to your favourable reply. Thank you.

Mit freundlichen Griilen

Best regards

Andrew Darren

Gmail - Re: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

E-mail: office3@iNEQ-global.com / A.Darren@outlook.com

Skype: INEQ-global

A Member of INEQ

Instrument & Equipment Specialties GmbH.

HRB 101267

USt/ VAT Nr.: DE298540110

EORI: DE405467942373828

Warenhaus / Warehouse:

c/lo Easy Speed International Logistics GmbH, Frankfurter Str. 83, 65479 Raunheim, Germany

Rechnungsanschrift / Invoice Address: Mergenthalerallee 45, 65760 Eschborn, Germany

From: office3@iNEQ-global.com [mailto:office3@INEQ-global.com]
Sent: Friday, January 12, 2024 3:05 PM

To: 'info@viamed.co.uk'

Subject: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

Sehr geehrte Damen und Herren,

Dear Sir or Madam,

Bitte legen Sie mir ein Angebot fir,

Pls. quote me your best prices for:

Hersteller  |Artikel Type/Bestellnummer Menge |Stlckpreis |Gesamtpreis
Pos.
Maker Article Type/Order NO Qty. Unit Price Total
CLASS R-22A
1 TELEDYNE SN:297688D9 2
Fracht
Freight

Lieferzeitpunkt: ASAP
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14/03/2024, 08:58 Gmail - Re: URGE: Inquiry-E24011103008-TELEDYNE

Time of Delivery: ASAP

Verpackung: kein unbehandeltes Holz, keine Europaletten; Karton, Sperrholz, Einwegpaletten aus Presspanplatten
sind OK.

Packaging: no untreated wood, no euro-pallets; carton, plywood, or one-way pallets made of press board are OK.

Lieferort: Deutschland

Place of Delivery: Germany

Achtung: bitte unbedingt die Anfragenummer (siehe Betreffzeile) im Angebot anfiihren —
Danke!

Attention: Pls. make sure to mention inquiry number (ref. line) in your offer — Thanks!

Mit freundlichen Grif3en

Best regards

Andrew Darren

E-mail: office3@INEQ-global.com / a.darren@outlook.com
Skype: INEQ-global

Instrument & Equipment Specialties GmbH.

HRB 101267

USt / VAT Nr.: DE298540110

EORI: DE405467942373828 Warenhaus / Warehouse:
c/o Easy Speed International Logistics GmbH, Frankfurter Str. 83, 65479 Raunheim, Germany
Rechnungsanschrift / Invoice Address: Mergenthalerallee 45, 65760 Eschborn, Germany
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