04/03/2024, 10:51 Gmail - Fwd: Oxygen sensors for Atom Dual Incu |

M Gma" Aqgib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen sensors for Atom Dual Incu |

Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 4 March 2024 at 10:18
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we provide Boris with a proforma invoice on contact record CID26914 (Advanced Software Solutions
Yazilim Ltd)

160x 0110073 R-22VA (pair of 2)
EUR distributor pricing
Delivery EXW - the client is making the transport arrangements

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Boris Mirniy <boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru>
Date: Fri, 1 Mar 2024 at 11:57

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensors for Atom Dual Incu |
To: ryan swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,
due to the logistics route it is better if our forwarder picks up the goods from you.

C yBaxkeHuem,
MwupHbIi Bopuc.

+7 495 215 10 31 oduc/office
+7 910 405 57 67 mob6./mobile

Best regards,
Boris Mirniy.

OT: "Ryan Swaine" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Komy: "boris mirniy" <boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru>
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OtnpaBneHHble: YeTBepr, 29 ®epanb 2024 r 11:28:26
Tema: Re: Oxygen sensors for Atom Dual Incu |

Hi Boris
That's great news. Please can you provide us with a postal code / Zip code for the company in
Turkey, as we will need this in order to calculate the carriage costs?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 29 Feb 2024 at 05:32, Boris Mirniy <boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
| finally have worked out the logistics route for the first order.

The order will be placed via Turkish company, please see the company details in the attached
file.

| would like to order 160 pairs of sensors invoiced in Euro: 160*EUR64= EUR 10 240.
Please send me proforma invoice asap.
Thank you in advance,

C yBaxkeHunem,
MwpHbIih Bopumc.

+7 495 215 10 31 oduc/office
+7 910 405 57 67 mob6./mobile

Best regards,
Boris Mirniy.

OT: "Ryan Swaine" <office@viamed.co.uk>

Komy: "boris mirniy" <boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru>
OtnpaBneHHble: NoHegenbHuK, 20 Hos6pb 2023 1 11:54:25
Tema: Re: Oxygen sensors for Atom Dual Incu |

Dear Boris

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792590529295495177 &simpl=msg-f:1792590529295...  2/4


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru

04/03/2024, 10:51 Gmail - Fwd: Oxygen sensors for Atom Dual Incu |
Thank you very much for your email and taking the time to visit us at Medica.

Please find our distributor pricing for the Atom compatible O2 sensors:

R-22VA (pack of 2 sensors) - pn. 0110073 =
GBP £64 / pair EXW
USD $80 / pair EXW
EUR €64 / pair EXW

Please let me know how you would like to proceed and if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 20 Nov 2023 at 08:45, Boris Mirniy <boris.mirniy@safire-med.ru> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
it was great meeting you in Dusseldorf.

We have discussed purchasing of O2 sensors for Atom Dual Incu | for Russia, via third
country.

Following our conversation, please provide the quotation on the mentioned O2 sensor
(pack of 2) and th HS code for them, so we could ask our logistics department to pick the
optimal route, that would eliminate any risk in current conditions for you and for us.

Thank you in advance,

C yBaxkeHunem,
MwupHbI Bopuc.

2% cacpatip

+7 495 215 10 31 oduc/office
+7 910 405 57 67 mob6./mobile

Best regards,
Boris Mirniy.
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2% safire

3 attachments

% safire mem

cacpadip -~

@ ADVANCED SEKERBANK NUMARALARI .docx
22K
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