27/02/2024, 14:30 Gmail - R: Order n. 466 of 26-02-2024
M G| | |a|| Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

R: Order n. 466 of 26-02-2024

Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it> 27 February 2024 at 14:18
To: Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Aqib,
Sorry, | think | didn’t explain myself well.

We still want to buy 2pcs and have just n.1 shipping, but since we already paid shipping + insurance + 1 sensor my colleagues are asking me if we could have a Pl for just n.1pc..

Best Regards

Purchase Department

Omniacell Tertia Srl

Via Dante Alighieri 8,

50028 — Barberino-Tavarnelle — (Fl) — ltaly

Tel: +39 055-8068060 — Fax: +39 055-8078382
Mail: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

Web: www.omniacelltertia.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 1/16
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Riservatezza dei dati - Regolamento UE sulla privacy GDPR 2016/679
Le informazioni ed eventuali allegati contenuti nella presente comunicazione, sono riservati ad uso esclusivo dei destinatari.
Qualora questa e-mail fosse pervenuta per errore, preghiamo di eliminarla senza copiarla o inoltrarla a terzi.

Per ogni segnalazione a riguardo, gentilmente inviare un messaggio di ritorno all'indirizzo e-mail del mittente.

Da: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Inviato: martedi 27 febbraio 2024 14:42

A: Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it>
Oggetto: Re: Order n. 466 of 26-02-2024

Hello

Good afternoon

Yesterday you sent me another purchase order (466) and requested to add another sensor on it.
Would you like me to remove that sensor from the order?

How would you like to ship the order?

Kind regards

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 2/16
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Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 3/16
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On Tue, 27 Feb 2024 at 13:34, Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it> wrote:

Hello Aqib,

Sorry to bother again but can you please send us a proforma with only n.1pc of sensor without transport and insurance please?

Best Regards

Purchase Department

Omniacell Tertia Srl

Via Dante Alighieri 8,

50028 — Barberino-Tavarnelle — (Fl) — Italy

Tel: +39 055-8068060 — Fax: +39 055-8078382
Mail: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

Web: www.omniacelltertia.com
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Riservatezza dei dati - Regolamento UE sulla privacy GDPR 2016/679
Le informazioni ed eventuali allegati contenuti nella presente comunicazione, sono riservati ad uso esclusivo dei destinatari.

Qualora questa e-mail fosse pervenuta per errore, preghiamo di eliminarla senza copiarla o inoltrarla a terzi.
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Per ogni segnalazione a riguardo, gentilmente inviare un messaggio di ritorno all'indirizzo e-mail del mittente.

Da: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Inviato: lunedi 26 febbraio 2024 16:34

A: Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it>
Oggetto: Re: Order n. 466 of 26-02-2024

Hello

Good afternoon

We still have not received any payment into our bank yet.

If you have made payment for order 460 then you will also need to make a payment of €203.92 for order 466 because that is the difference in the orders.

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.

Kind regards

Agib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 26 Feb 2024 at 15:31, Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it> wrote:

Thank you Agib, but we have paid already for our order #460.

Please, see enclosed

Thank you
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Best Regards

Purchase Department

Omniacell Tertia Srl

Via Dante Alighieri 8,

50028 — Barberino-Tavarnelle — (Fl) — Italy

Tel: +39 055-8068060 — Fax: +39 055-8078382
Mail: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

Web: www.omniacelltertia.com
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Riservatezza dei dati - Regolamento UE sulla privacy GDPR 2016/679
Le informazioni ed eventuali allegati contenuti nella presente comunicazione, sono riservati ad uso esclusivo dei destinatari.
Qualora questa e-mail fosse pervenuta per errore, preghiamo di eliminarla senza copiarla o inoltrarla a terzi.

Per ogni segnalazione a riguardo, gentilmente inviare un messaggio di ritorno all'indirizzo e-mail del mittente.

Da: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Inviato: lunedi 26 febbraio 2024 15:55

A: Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it>
Oggetto: Re: Order n. 466 of 26-02-2024

Hello

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 7116
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Good afternoon

| have added another UFO 130-2 Sensor to your order 460/466.

Please see attached below for your proforma invoice.

You will need to make payment so we can dispatch your order.

Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 8/16
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 26 Feb 2024 at 14:22, Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it> wrote:

Hello,

Please wait to ship our order #460 because we have n.1 more sensor to add.

Enclosed our order #466.

Thank you,
Best Regards

Purchase Department

Omniacell Tertia Srl

Via Dante Alighieri 8,

50028 — Barberino-Tavarnelle — (Fl) — Italy

Tel: +39 055-8068060 — Fax: +39 055-8078382

Mail: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 9/16
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Web: www.omniacelltertia.com
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Riservatezza dei dati - Regolamento UE sulla privacy GDPR 2016/679
Le informazioni ed eventuali allegati contenuti nella presente comunicazione, sono riservati ad uso esclusivo dei destinatari.
Qualora questa e-mail fosse pervenuta per errore, preghiamo di eliminarla senza copiarla o inoltrarla a terzi.

Per ogni segnalazione a riguardo, gentilmente inviare un messaggio di ritorno all'indirizzo e-mail del mittente.

Da: Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it>
Inviato: lunedi 26 febbraio 2024 12:15

A: 'Aqib Majeed' <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Oggetto: R: Ordine n. 460 del 23/02/2024

Deair,

in attached he wire transfer.

Best Regards.

Purchase Department

Omniacell Tertia Srl

Via Dante Alighieri 8,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 10/16
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50028 — Barberino-Tavarnelle — (Fl) — Italy

Tel: +39 055-8068060 — Fax: +39 055-8078382
Mail: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

Web: www.omniacelltertia.com
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Riservatezza dei dati - Regolamento UE sulla privacy GDPR 2016/679
Le informazioni ed eventuali allegati contenuti nella presente comunicazione, sono riservati ad uso esclusivo dei destinatari.
Qualora questa e-mail fosse pervenuta per errore, preghiamo di eliminarla senza copiarla o inoltrarla a terzi.

Per ogni segnalazione a riguardo, gentilmente inviare un messaggio di ritorno all'indirizzo e-mail del mittente.

Da: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Inviato: lunedi 26 febbraio 2024 10:47

A: Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it>
Oggetto: Re: Ordine n. 460 del 23/02/2024

Hello

Good morning
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Thank you for spotting that.

My apologies, | have amended that mistake.

Please see attached below for the amended proforma invoice, can you please check and see if everything on there is correct.

If you require any further assistance please let me know.

Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered,
but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 26 Feb 2024 at 07:51, Omniacell Tertia Srl - Purchase <purchase@omniacelltertia.it> wrote:

Good morning,

Thank you for your PI.

It seems everything correct except for the address: there seems to be an “e” more, please see below.

Best Regards

Purchase Department

Omniacell Tertia Srl

Via Dante Alighieri 8,

50028 — Barberino-Tavarnelle — (Fl) — Italy

Tel: +39 055-8068060 — Fax: +39 055-8078382

Mail: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 13/16
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Riservatezza dei dati - Regolamento UE sulla privacy GDPR 2016/679
Le informazioni ed eventuali allegati contenuti nella presente comunicazione, sono riservati ad uso esclusivo dei destinatari.
Qualora questa e-mail fosse pervenuta per errore, preghiamo di eliminarla senza copiarla o inoltrarla a terzi.

Per ogni segnalazione a riguardo, gentilmente inviare un messaggio di ritorno all'indirizzo e-mail del mittente.

Da: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>
Inviato: venerdi 23 febbraio 2024 17:44

A: purchase@omniacelltertia.it

Oggetto: Ordine n. 460 del 23/02/2024

Hello

Good afternoon.

Thank you for your order, 460

Please see below for your attached proforma.

This proforma invoice is only valid for 30 days

Can you have a look and see if all details on the proforma including addresses are correct or if any amendments are required.
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If you are happy and wish to proceed, please make payment for the total amount stated on the proforma.

| do need to advise you we currently have a lead time of 3-4 weeks as we are out of stock of the Oxygen Sensor UFO 130-2, of course if they arrive sooner we will
make you aware.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 1792062038348927103&simpl=msg-f:1792062038348927103&mb=1 15/16
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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