
20/02/2024, 13:34 Gmail - Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM146449-1

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r-7421690710714924884%7Cmsg-f:17914164422883… 1/3

Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM146449-1
1 message

Thomas Rowe <thomas.rowe@hayley-group.co.uk> Tue, Feb 20, 2024 at 11:17 AM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Good Morning Sophie

Please find attached PO

Kind Regards

Tom Rowe

Tom Rowe
Internal Sales
Hayley Group Limited
Unit 58 Oldmedow Road, Hardwick Ind Est, Norfolk, PE30 4LA
[Tel] +44 (0)1553 770660 | [Fax] +44 (0)1553 770733
[Email] thomas.rowe@hayley-group.co.uk

From: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 20 February 2024 11:00
To: Thomas Rowe <thomas.rowe@hayley-group.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM146449-1
 
Hi Thomas, 

Thank you for your email - the price breaks for the MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor (part number 0110432) which were ordered on
RVM146449-1 are as follows:

1 unit - £66.00
2 units - £64.40
3-10 units - £62.70
11+ units - £59.40

We have these available in stock and the carriage would be free of charge. 

If you require prices for any other sensors please let me know.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Tuesday, Wednesday and Thursday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 
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http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
----------------

On Mon, Feb 19, 2024 at 4:07 PM Thomas Rowe <thomas.rowe@hayley-group.co.uk> wrote:
Good Afternoon Sophie

Can I please have an updated price and availability for two the following

Kind Regards

Tom Rowe

Tom Rowe
Internal Sales
Hayley Group Limited
Unit 58 Oldmedow Road, Hardwick Ind Est, Norfolk, PE30 4LA
[Tel] +44 (0)1553 770660 | [Fax] +44 (0)1553 770733
[Email] thomas.rowe@hayley-group.co.uk

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 27 November 2023 13:03
To: Thomas Rowe <thomas.rowe@hayley-group.co.uk>
Subject: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM146449-1
 
Please find attached Viamed Ltd. invoice(s) for your recent order.

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us accounts@viamed.co.uk

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------
Company No: 1257303 VAT No: GB 292 0546 04 The information contained in this e-mail is intended only for the person or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. If you are not the intended recipient of
this e-mail, the use of this information or any disclosure, copying or distribution is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If
you received this e-mail in error, please contact the sender immediately and delete the material from any computer. The
views expressed in this e-mail may not necessarily be the views of Hayley Group Limited and should not be taken as
authority to carry out any instruction contained within.
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