19/02/2024, 14:35 Gmail - Fwd: Hamilton Flow sensor

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Hamilton Flow sensor

1 message

Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 19 February 2024 at 09:31

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Please can we send Sadaf Medical (CID26972) a proforma invoice:

2x Hamilton Flow Sensors - box of 6 - pn. 4310009 = $ 39.00 / each box EXW
Sadaf Medical Supplies

Khalda 11953 Amman — Jordan

Complex 67 - Amer Bin Malek Street — 1st Floor

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <info@sadafmedical.com>

Date: Sun, 18 Feb 2024 at 06:08

Subject: RE: Hamilton Flow sensor

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <mutaz@sadafmedical.com>, mohammed <mohammed@sadafmedical.com>

Dear Ryan,

Kindly use the below:

Sadaf Medical Supplies
Khalda 11953 Amman — Jordan

Complex 67 - Amer Bin Malek Street — 1st Floor

Regards,

Ms. Mai Al Shalabi

Sadaf Medical Supplies

11953 Amman — Jordan

Complex 67 - Amer Bin Malek Street — 1st Floor
Tele: +962 6 5333678 Fax: +962 6 5330100
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From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, February 16, 2024 6:46 PM

To: inffo@sadafmedical.com

Subject: Re: Hamilton Flow sensor

Dear Ms. Mai Al Shalabi

Please can you confirm your complete delivery and billing address and | will have a proforma sent to you.

I look forward to your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 14 Feb 2024 at 12:59, <info@sadafmedical.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

We need 2 boxes.

Regards,

Ms. Mai Al Shalabi

Sadaf Medical Supplies

11953 Amman — Jordan

Complex 67 - Amer Bin Malek Street — 1st Floor
Tele: +962 6 5333678 Fax: +962 6 5330100

From: info@sadafmedical.com <info@sadafmedical.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 14, 2024 3:30 PM

To: 'ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk' <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>; 'mohammed' <mohammed@sadafmedical.com>
Cc: 'Abu Zaiton Mutaz' <mutaz@sadafmedical.com>

Subject: RE: Hamilton Flow sensor

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1791319191546978126%7Cmsg-f:179131919154697 ... 2/7


mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:info@sadafmedical.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:info@sadafmedical.com
mailto:info@sadafmedical.com
mailto:info@sadafmedical.com
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:mohammed@sadafmedical.com
mailto:mutaz@sadafmedical.com

19/02/2024, 14:35 Gmail - Fwd: Hamilton Flow sensor
Thank you Ryan.

Dear Mohamed,

Please advise how much sensors you need.

Regards,

Ms. Mai Al Shalabi

Sadaf Medical Supplies

11953 Amman — Jordan

Complex 67 - Amer Bin Malek Street — 1st Floor
Tele: +962 6 5333678 Fax: +962 6 5330100

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 14, 2024 3:28 PM
To: info@sadafmedical.com

Subject: Re: Hamilton Flow sensor

Dear Ms. Mai Al Shalabi

For the small single box order we can accept card payment, but not for larger orders.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Sun, 11 Feb 2024 at 10:30, <info@sadafmedical.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Please advise if you accept credit card payment.
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Regards,

Ms. Mai Al Shalabi

Sadaf Medical Supplies

11953 Amman — Jordan

Complex 67 - Amer Bin Malek Street — 1st Floor

Tele: +962 6 5333678 Fax: +962 6 5330100

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 8, 2024 4:58 PM

To: mohammed <mohammed@sadafmedical.com>

Cc: mutaz@sadafmedical.com; info@sadafmedical.com
Subject: Re: Hamilton Flow sensor

Hi Mohammed

1) country of origin: Germany

2&3) Unfortunately we no longer offer single sensors or free of charge samples. We can only supply a complete box of 6
and these would be chargeable.

| am sorry | can not be of more help on this matter.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 8 Feb 2024 at 12:32, mohammed <mohammed@sadafmedical.com> wrote:

Hello Rayan,

Thanks for the incoming email.
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Please see the following points:
1- Please advise country of origin for the flow sensor.

2-Normally manufacturer supply free samples as a part of business support
while distributor handleing the shipping cost.

3- So, based on above please cofirm providing us with a free box for proper
evalaution.

Note" My colleague Mai who is copied on the CC will help with moving
samples to Jordan", so please keep her posted.

Thanks.

Great People + Total Customer Focus + Great Technology = Success.

Best Regards

Mohamed Abuzitoon.

Sales Director.

SADAF Medical supplies Est.

67 Amer bin Malek street,3rd floor,Suite 301
Khalda,P.O Box 4412, Amman ,11953 Jordan
Tel: +962 5333 678

Fax: +962 5330 100

GSM : +962 798224705

From: Ryan Swaine [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, February 07, 2024 7:24 PM

To: mohammed

Cc: mutaz@sadafmedical.com

Subject: Re: Hamilton Flow sensor

Dear Mohammed
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Thank you very much for your email and your call today, it was nice to speak with you.

The Hamilton flow sensors are supplied in a box of 6 pieces, please find the details below:
Hamilton Flow Sensors - box of 6 - pn. 4310009 = $ 39.00 / box EXW
| have checked, but unfortunately we do not have any single samples; | can only supply a box.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 7 Feb 2024 at 12:01, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: mohammed <mohammed@sadafmedical.com>
Date: Wed, 7 Feb 2024 at 11:56

Subject: Hamilton Flow sensor

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: <mutaz@sadafmedical.com>

Hello Rayan,

Good day,

Referring to the above subject and based on our phone call
today, kindly provide us with your best price for qty of 100 Flow
sensor to fit with Hamilton Ventilator. Also please provide us
with your FDA and Or CE certificate.

Thank you again and get well soon.
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Great People + Total Customer Focus + Great Technology =
Success.

Best Regards

Mohamed Abuzitoon.

Sales Director.

SADAF Medical supplies Est.

67 Amer bin Malek street,3rd floor,Suite 301
Khalda,P.O Box 4412 , Amman ,11953 Jordan
Tel: +962 5333 678

Fax: +962 5330 100

GSM : +962 798224705
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