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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com> 19 February 2024 at 09:21
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we send Syed Ali at Avens Medical Supplies CID21029 a proforma invoice for 5x R-49V.

Thank you, Ryan

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Date: Sun, 18 Feb 2024 at 11:42
Subject:
To: <ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk>
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