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M G| | |a|| Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 16 February 2024 at 11:09
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please send them a proforma invoice for 2x R-30V (0110040)
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com>

Date: Fri, 16 Feb 2024 at 10:26

Subject: RE: OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: Ramadani, Oltion (GE Healthcare) <oltion@yesspharma.com>, Dren, Shabani (yesspharma, Non-GE) <dren@yesspharma.com>

Hello Ryan,

Do you have stock for this sensor? If yes please send to us pro forma invoice for 2 pcs.
R-30V - pn. 0110040

Thank you,
Heroik
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From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2024 6:44 PM

To: Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com>
Subject: Re: 0OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

Dear Heroik

M10 Galvanic O2 Sensor - 6050-0004-110
| am pleased to inform you that our R-30V would be a suitable replacement.

R-30V - pn. 0110040 = EUR €56 each EXW

&

2071018-001-S

Unfortunately we do not currently offer a suitable replacement for this sensor.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
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Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 15 Feb 2024 at 13:14, Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan,

Do you have these 02 sensors:
M10 Galvanic 02 Sensor - 6050-0004-110

02 Sensor - 2071018-001-S

Thanks,
Heroik

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2024 1:10 PM

To: Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com>
Subject: Re: OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

Dear Heroik

Thank you very much.

One of my colleagues from our sales office will be in contact with you very soon with a proforma invoice.

Kind regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 15 Feb 2024 at 11:20, Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,
Euro please.

Thank you,

Heroik

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2024 11:50 AM

To: Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com>
Subject: Re: OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

Dear Heroik

Thank you, do you prefer USD or EUR?
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Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 15 Feb 2024 at 10:42, Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan,

Please find below info:
Delivery and billing address:

YessPharma

Ferid Curri Str. no. 5, Local no. 10, Arbéri,
10000 Prishtina

Kosovo

VAT: 330471110

EORI: Not applicable in Kosovo

Contact person details:

Heroik Lusha
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+38344339991

heroik@yesspharma.com

Thanks and regards,

Heroik

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2024 11:09 AM

To: Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com>
Subject: Re: OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

Dear Heroik

Thank you. It is best | reply from our medical company, as Viamed carries stock of the sensors you require.

OOM102-1

We have a Viamed labeled version that is manufactured by the same manufacturer, Envitec-Honeywell:

R-17Vi - pn. 0110019

Distributor pricing = USD $32.50 / EUR €26 each EXW

Available from stock

If you would like to proceed with an order, please can you provide me with the delivery/billing address, VAT/eori numbers and the contact details for the responsible
persons within your company.

As soon as we have this information, we can provide you with a proforma invoice.

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.
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Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 15 Feb 2024 at 09:58, Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan,
Thank you for quick replay!

Yes we need for anesthesia machine.

3 pcs sensors.

Thank you,
Heroik

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2024 10:48 AM
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To: Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com>
Subject: Re: OOM111 Oxygen Sensor

Dear Heroik

Thank you very much for your email.

Sensor OOM102-1 is a medical certified sensor, do you need this sensor for use in a medical application?

If you do, then we can quote you from our big sister company that takes care of sales and service to the medical industry. If not, | can find a compatible one for you.

Please can you let me know how many sensors you are looking for?

| look forward to your reply.

Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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On Thu, 15 Feb 2024 at 09:41, Heroik Lusha <heroik@yesspharma.com> wrote:

Hello dear,
Hope you are doing great!
We are interested for this type of sensor : Oxygen sensor OOM102-1 .

Could you tell me the price?
Thank you and best regards,

Heroik

Heroik Lusha

Service Leader

heroik@yesspharma.com | +383 44 339 991 | www.yesspharma.com

YessPharma Sh.P.K. @ Ferid Curri Str. no. 5, Local no. 10, Arbéri, 10000 Prishtina, Kosovo

YessPharma GmbH @ Werner-von-Siemens-Stralle 5, 74564 Crailsheim, Germany | +49 1590 3787882

This message contains confidential information. To know more, please click in the following link.
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