08/02/2024, 12:15 Gmail - Fwd: Teledyne R-22A Oxygen Sensors

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Teledyne R-22A Oxygen Sensors

Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 8 February 2024 at 11:57
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we send Sergen a proforma invoice for 50x R-22A sensors. Account CID15613

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <sergen@ozakgaz.com.tr>

Date: Thu, 8 Feb 2024 at 11:50

Subject: Teledyne R-22A Oxygen Sensors

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>
Cc: <yakup.colkesen@ozakgaz.com.tr>, <Levent@ozakgaz.com.tr>, <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

Please quote for 50 pcs R22A oxygen sensor including transport costs.

Best Regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1790331781388364611&simpl=msg-f: 1790331781388364611&mb=1 1/2
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08/02/2024, 12:15 Gmail - Fwd: Teledyne R-22A Oxygen Sensors
Sergen Un

Project Engineer
Mob: +90 533 674 2300
Phone/Fax: +90 324 616 00 36/79

€g5zak

Adana Bulvari No:125
Tarsus, Mersin
Web: www.ozakgaz.com.tr

E-mail: sergen@ozakgaz.com.tr
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