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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: VIAMED LTD - NEW ORDER OF SENSORS R-17MED TO ARGENTINA - P.O. #
6000003994 - MEDIX S.R.L. -
Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 7 February 2024 at 09:27
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we change the proforma accordingly.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Luis Domínguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>
Date: Tue, 6 Feb 2024 at 18:32
Subject: VIAMED LTD - NEW ORDER OF SENSORS R-17MED TO ARGENTINA - P.O. # 6000003994 - MEDIX
S.R.L. -
To: viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>, ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
<ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Christian Miro <christian.miro@medix.com.ar>, Victoria Cerverizzo <Victoria.Cerverizzo@medix.com.ar>

Dear Janine & Ryan,

 

Attached pls find the following New Purchase Order,

 

 

O/C 6000003994, for 60 units of Teledyne Sensor R-17MED (our code TE.C.43690 - Celda R17
RoHS).

 

 

Also pls be advised that this order, finally will be paid directly by Medix (not Xidem involved)...,

 

We apologize for these changes, but we are looking for the best way to proceed, to avoid delays and obstacles, in
orders to Argentina.

 

 

Please confirm receipt ok of our order, and estimated delivery date…,
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Please, DO NOT send yourself by any Courier firm…, our FFWW will cordinate with you, for the pickup of the
goods (once be paid, and ready).

 

 

Thanks in advance for your understanding and help.

 

Kind rgds.

 

 

Luis Dominguez  /  Compras & Abastecimiento 

    luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
  +54 9 11 3323-2319

  medix.com.ar

 

 

 

   

 

Para conocer más de nosotros presione aquí

 

De: Luis Domínguez
Enviado el: miércoles, 31 de enero de 2024 11:55
Para: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
CC: Christian Miro <christian.miro@medix.com.ar>; Victoria Cerverizzo <Victoria.Cerverizzo@medix.com.ar>; Andres
Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR PROFORMA - QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - MEDIX S.R.L.

 

Hi Ryan, good day…

 

Tks you very much for yr reply and kind assistance…!!

 

Our internat’ trade dept (Christian/Victoria), will revert to you with belonging P.O. asap.
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Best rgds.

 

 

Luis Dominguez  /  Compras & Abastecimiento 

    luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
  +54 9 11 3323-2319

  medix.com.ar

 

 

 

   

 

Para conocer más de nosotros presione aquí

 

De: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Enviado el: miércoles, 31 de enero de 2024 11:15
Para: Luis Domínguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: Re: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR PROFORMA - QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - MEDIX
S.R.L.

 

Hi Luis

 

We are expecting new stock to arrive any day now, so there should not be any delays.

 

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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Code Description Quantity

 

On Wed, 31 Jan 2024 at 13:47, Luis Domínguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Good day dear Aqib and Ryan,

 

About this order of the R-17 Med sensors, what would be the Lead time, from when the payment is made.

 

This info in order to coordinate the pickup with our FFWW at yr side.

 

Tks and best rgds.

 

 

Luis Dominguez  /  Compras & Abastecimiento 

    luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
  +54 9 11 3323-2319

  medix.com.ar

 

 

 

    TodoGratisInternet.com en Twitter | Icono de twitter, Autocad ...

 

Para conocer más de nosotros presione aquí

 

De: Luis Domínguez
Enviado el: martes, 30 de enero de 2024 17:39
Para: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk; ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
CC: Christian Miro <christian.miro@medix.com.ar>; Victoria Cerverizzo <Victoria.Cerverizzo@medix.com.ar>;
Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR PROFORMA - QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - MEDIX S.R.L.

 

Good day dear Aqib and Ryan,

 

Regarding attached quotation, we received OK for purchase of only Sensor R-17MED:
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TE.C.43690 Celda R17 (RoHS) UL /  Sensor R-17MED 60 units
 

So in order to
comply with our customs regulations, please we need the following from you:

 

Documents needed:

 

* Proforma Invoice (with Incoterm, Payment Terms, Currency, Estimated ETD).

 

Information needed:

 

* Weight & dimensions of the cargo

* Origin of the items.

* Commercial Brand of the items.

* Address of the factory for the pickup.

* MSDS if any item has battery.

* Serial number of the items.

* Expiration date - It must be longer than 18 months.

 

* LABEL INFORMATION MASTER BOX: origin - item number - commercial brand.

 

* PAYMENT INFORMATION:

As per Payment terms: “Prepaid” (100% before shipment)…, the payment will be made through XIDEM
MEDICAL LLC (our subsidiary in the USA).

 

So please kindly issue the Proforma Invoice, with info as follows:

 

Bill to/Buyer:

XIDEM MEDICAL LLC.

2330 PONCE DE LEON BLVD

CORAL GABLES, FL 33134, USA.

FEI NUMBER: 37-1975724.

 

Sent to/Ship to:

MEDIX MEDICAL DEVICES SRL

JEAN MERMOZ 1750 EL TALAR

BUENOS AIRES B1618EWC

ARGENTINA
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Tks in advance for yr prompt reply with Formal Proforma Invoice (for 60 units Sensor R-17MED), in order to
comply the process with customs.

 

Any questions, pls do not hesitate to ask.

 

Best rgds,

 

 

 

 

Luis Dominguez  /  Compras & Abastecimiento 

    luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
  +54 9 11 3323-2319

  medix.com.ar

 

 

 

   

 

Para conocer más de nosotros presione aquí

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Aqib Majeed
Enviado el: jueves, 18 de enero de 2024 12:39
Para: Luis Domínguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>
CC: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR NEW QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - MEDIX SRL

 

Hello Luis

 

Good afternoon 

 

Thank you for the proforma request.
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Please see attached below for your proforma invoice detailing the price and product you require.

 

I have put it on as EXW but if you prefer to pay carriage I can work that out for your an add it on so let me know.

This proforma invoice is only valid for 30 days

Can you have a look and see if all details on the proforma including addresses are correct or if any amendments
are required.

 

If you are happy and wish to proceed, please make payment for the total amount stated on the proforma.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

 

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Please note:  Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------
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