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M Gmall Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: PO 4300034020

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 31 January 2024 at 12:05
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Birmingham.Purchasing@continental.com <Birmingham.Purchasing@continental.com>

Date: Wed, 31 Jan 2024 at 12:00

Subject: PO 4300034020

To: Birmingham.Purchasing@continental.com <Birmingham.Purchasing@continental.com>, kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon,
Please see attached PO 4300034020. Can you please confirm receipt and delivery date?
Thank you in advance,

Kind Regards /Mit freundlichen Griien /Sincéres Salutations,

Chloe Underwood
Purchasing Assistant

Automotive Aftermarket
Smart Mobility (SMY) UK & Ireland

Automotive

Phone: + 44 (0) 121 725 1389
E-mail: Chloe.underwood@continental-corporation.com

Continental Automotive Trading UK Ltd
Unit 36

Gravelly Industrial Park

Birmingham

West Midlands

B24 8TA

Can you please direct all invoices, statements and account payment enquiries to
Amanda.McKeever@continental-corporation.com or Linda.Germain@continental-corporation.com. They will be
able to process your invoice and deal with and inform you of any delays with your payment
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*Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this e-mail*

Proprietary and confidential. Distribution only by express authority of Continental AG or its subsidiaries.

This communication contains information which is confidential and may also be privileged. It is for the exclusive use of the
addressee(s). If you are not the addressee please note that any distribution, reproduction, copying, publication or use of this
communication or the information in it is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please contact us immediately
and also delete the communication from your computer. Any views or opinions presented are solely those of the author and do not
necessarily represent those of the Company unless otherwise specifically stated.

Internal

PO 4300034020.pdf
L2 11K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1789607270258021224%7Cmsg-f:1789607561299109705...  2/2



