18/01/2024, 14:11 Gmail - Fwd: Oxygen sensors

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen sensors

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 18 January 2024 at 13:06
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we set up an account (EUR Distributor) and provide them with a proforma invoice for 150x 0110073. All of their company details are listed in the thread, but
please let me know if there is anything else you need.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: belsales <belsales@zohomail.eu>
Date: Thu, 18 Jan 2024 at 09:54

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensors

To: ryanswaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: office <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan

Thanks for your reply.

Yes, the price suits me, but an additional discount is welcome :)
Please send me a proforma invoice.

As a contact, you can write me down as Nikolay Semenov or Andrey Bliznyuk (andrei.blizniuk@gmail.com).

The main activity of the company is medical equipment and consumables. We work with companies such as Abbott, Boston Scientific, Byosense Webster, Atom Medical
and others

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 17884 3362190823914 2&simpl=msg-f:1788433621908239142&mb=1 1/3
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With respect, Nikolay

Sent using Zoho Mail

---- BT, 16 siHB. 2024 17:46:07 +0200 nonb3oBatenb Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Hanucan ---

Dear Nikolay

Thank you very much for your email. We would be very happy to quote you for our R-22VA sensor, please find our distributor pricing below:

R-22VA (pack of 2) - 0110073 = EUR €64 EXW

Please let me know if you are happy with our offer and | will provide you with a proforma invoice including delivery costs.

Please can you also give me the names and contact information for the responsible persons within your organisation so | can set up your company within our system?
Please can you also give me a brief overview of your company; which companies and products you currently represent?

I look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: belsales <belsales@zohomail.eu>
Date: Tue, 16 Jan 2024 at 07:43

Subject: Fwd: Oxygen sensors

To: orders <orders@viamed.co.uk>
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Dear Partner

My name is Nikolay, | represent the company UAB "ATIG LT" Vilnius. We would like to buy oxygen sensors:
Part Number: 0110073 - 150 Pkg (300 pcs)

Could you please sen me PI

UAB «ATIG LT»

Reg. Nr: 305534783

VAT Nr.: LT100014898617

Pylimo g. 33-33, LT-01309 Vilnius, Lithuania
Tel: +37064364089

IBAN: LTO77180300048467552

Bank: AB Siauliu Bankas, Seimyniskiu g. 1A, LT-09312, Vilnius, Lietuva
Reg. Nr: 112025254

Bank code: 71800

VAT Nr.: LT120252515

SWIFT (BIC): CBSBLT26

Best regards, Nikolay
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