16/01/2024, 11:00 Gmail - Re: Customer Account Query - Credit account setup

M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Customer Account Query - Credit account setup
1 message

helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 January 2024 at 10:53
Reply-To: helen.lamb@yviamed.co.uk

To: charitablefunds@eastamb.nhs.uk

Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Harry

Yes you have an account with us, | have had a look and we have two delivery accounts one was 30 days and one was
proforma.
| have made them both 30 day credit account terms and let the sales staff know.

My colleague Kate is now processing the orders for you. | have cc'd her in, so you can contact her if you have
any questions regarding the orders.

Kind regards

Helen Lamb
Accounts Director
Viamed Ltd

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: helen.lamb@yviamed.co.uk
Email: helen.lamb@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 16 Jan 2024 at 10:23, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: charitablefunds <charitablefunds@eastamb.nhs.uk>

Date: Tue, 16 Jan 2024 at 10:21

Subject: Customer Account Query - Credit account setup

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>, office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Kate Lott <Kate.Lott@eastamb.nhs.uk>, charitablefunds <charitablefunds@eastamb.nhs.uk>

Good afternoon,
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16/01/2024, 11:00 Gmail - Re: Customer Account Query - Credit account setup

| am enquiring about our customer account with you, can you confirm we have a customer account, as the East of
England Ambulance Service NHS Trust has traded with you in the past?

The reason for my email is that we have a few orders with you that cannot be processed until payment is made,
(orders below) however, our standard practice is to pay a valid invoice within the standard 30 day terms upon receipt
of the goods /service.

I am looking to get these orders replaced and fulfilled on 30 credit terms, can you assist me with this please?

e« CHAR23/0176
« CHAR23/0201

Kind regards,

. Harry Keen | Management Accounts Assistant

East of England
Ambulance Service

charity

@ Harry.Keen@eastamb.nhs.uk

e 01603 422731

www.eastamb.nhs.uk

Twitter | Facebook | Instagram

”" ASK ME ABOUT MY ROLE AS AN INCLUSION & DIVERSITY AMBASSADOR
= CLICK HERE TO FIND OUT MORE

This email transmission and all attached files contain information intended for the designated individual or entity to
whom it is addressed and may contain information that is proprietary, privileged and/or exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or other use of this email
or its attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately by
replying to this message and please delete the original message without making any copies. This email transmission
and all attached files contain information intended for the designated individual or entity to whom it is addressed and
may contain information that is proprietary, privileged and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are
not the intended recipient or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or other use of this email or its attachments is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately by replying to this
message and please delete the original message without making any copies.
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