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M G ma|l Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Re: Purchase Order No: RR8N400427686 from : Leeds Teaching Hospitals
NHS Trust (Oracle) - (Duplicate) - Ticket [218593]

1 message

eProcurement <Ith.eprocurement@nhs.net> 15 January 2024 at 16:15
Reply-To: eProcurement <Ith.eprocurement@nhs.net>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate,
Line 2 has been cancelled.

Kind regards

Kiz Schofield

Purchasing officer

Leeds Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust

St James University Hospital, Leeds LS9 7TF

53 Dolly Lane

Phone — 01134675188

eProc Enquiries: Ith.eprocurement@nhs.net

On Mon, 15 Jan at 3:10 PM , Kate.griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Good afternoon Kiz,

Thank you for your amended order.

Please could | mention again that line 2 has a part number for a discontinued item - part number
2510000 - Microstim DB3 - nerve stimulator, though the description says patient leads.

The patient leads we have are as follows:
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Supplied with BNC cable.

2520000 Microstim DB3 - Patient Lead £18.00
Press Studs - Cable Length: 0.90m
Set of 2

2520001 Microstim DB3 - Patient Lead £19.00
Press Studs - Cable Length: 1.5m
Setof 2

2520003 Microstim DB3 - Patient Lead £20.00

Pinch Clamps - Cable Length: 1.5m
Set of 2

| am happy to proceed with this order, | could just omit line 2?

Unfortunately, since the order was originally placed in December, your account is now on hold
due to invoicing queries - your accounts department are aware of this.

Please could you email helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk if you need any further information relating to
invoices.

| await your reply about line 2.

Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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