04/01/2024, 10:04 Gmail - Fwd: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007 (Ref.n0:19-121245)

M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007 (Ref.n0:19-121245)

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 4 January 2024 at 09:48

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: jenny.chang <jenny.chang@inautom.de>

Date: Thu, 4 Jan 2024 at 09:44

Subject: AW: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007 (Ref.no:19-121245)
To: office <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,Kate Griffiths

Thank you very much for your quotation!

Our company's latest address is Nikolaus-Otto-Str. 9 28816 Stuhr, Germany.
What is the estimated shipping cost to Germany?

2024-01-04

Mit freundlichen GruRen/ Best regards
Jenny.chang

-Einkaufsabteilung/ Purchase department

| lT%l)OiTl

Inautom GmbH
Lieferadresse: Nikolaus-Otto-Str. 9 28816 Stuhr

Cell phone: +49-17670532878 (Frau Wei)
Telefon: +49 421 1618 1199

Telefax: +49 (0)421-80936534

E-mail: Jenny.chang@inautom.de

Web: www.inautom.de

Ust.-ID.DE 285897479

EORI: DE864236635297521

" Deutsche Bank

IBAN:DE86 3007 0010 0849 9873 00

SWIFT: DEUTDEDDXXX

Bank address: Filiale KOnigsallee 45/47 DUesseldorf 40189 Diesseldorf

Von: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Gesendet: 2024-01-04 17:32

Betreff: Re: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007 (Ref.no:19-121245)
An: "jenny.chang"<jenny.chang@inautom.de>

Cc:

Thank you Jenny,

The weights and dimensions are as follows:

31x31x31cm
3.20 kg

Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days. | have used the addresses as follows:
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Delivery Address Invoice Address
Inautom GmbH Inautom GmbH
Nikolaus-Otto-Str. 9 1 Etage Buro 5
Stuhr Hermann-Ritter-Str 108
28816 Bremen
Germany 28197

Germany

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call
+44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 4 Jan 2024 at 08:13, jenny.chang <jenny.chang@inautom.de> wrote:

Hello,Kate Griffiths
We can accept delivery time and can accept sensors being individually packaged.
We make a one-time purchase.

Pos. Manufacturer Model no. Product name Qty freight

Code: 0110081

1 Teledyne UFO 130-2

Oxygen sensor 30
1) lowest EXW price;

2) the weight for products

3) the delivery time.

4) freight charges

5) price list for your products catalog.

2024-01-04

Mit freundlichen GruRen/ Best regards
Jenny.chang

-Einkaufsabteilung/ Purchase department

Inaatom

Inautom GmbH
Lieferadresse: Nikolaus-Otto-Str. 9 28816 Stuhr

Cell phone: +49-17670532878 (Frau Wei)
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Telefon: +49 421 1618 1199
Telefax: +49 (0)421-80936534
E-mail: Jenny.chang@inautom.de
Web: www.inautom.de

Ust.-ID.DE 285897479

EORI: DE864236635297521

Deutsche Bank
IBAN:DE86 3007 0010 0849 9873 00
SWIFT: DEUTDEDDXXX
Bank address: Filiale KOnigsallee 45/47 DUesseldorf 40189 Diesseldorf

Von: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Gesendet: 2024-01-03 18:03

Betreff: Re: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007 (Ref.n0:19-121245)
An: "Jenny.chang"<Jenny.chang@inautom.de>

Cc:

Good morning Jenny,
Thank you for your email.
The lead time for part number 0110081 is approximately March 2024.

Before | can issue a quotation, please could | ask if you require the sensors to be individually boxed? (as you have asked for the
weights and dimensions to be provided)

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 3 Jan 2024 at 09:39, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: jenny.chang <jenny.chang@inautom.de>
Date: Wed, 3 Jan 2024 at 09:23
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Subject: RE: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007 (Ref.no:19-121245)
To: office <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,Kate Griffiths
Please provide a quotation as soon as possible, we need to purchase.

Pos. Manufacturer Model no. Product name Qty freight

Code: 0110081
1 Teledyne Oxygen sensor 30
UFO 130-2

2024-01-03

Mit freundlichen GruRen/ Best regards
Jenny.chang

-Einkaufsabteilung/ Purchase department

Inautom GmbH
Lieferadresse: Nikolaus-Otto-Str. 9 28816 Stuhr

Cell phone: +49-17670532878 (Frau Wei)
Telefon: +49 421 1618 1199

Telefax: +49 (0)421-80936534

E-mail: Jenny.chang@inautom.de

Web: www.inautom.de

Ust.-ID.DE 285897479

EORI: DE864236635297521

Deutsche Bank

IBAN:DE86 3007 0010 0849 9873 00
SWIFT: DEUTDEDDXXX

Bank address: Filiale KOnigsallee 45/47 DUesseldorf 40189 Diiesseldorf

Von: "jenny.chang"<jenny.chang@inautom.de>
Gesendet: 2024-01-03 16:35

Betreff: Inquiry for Teledyne-P240103007

An: "office"<office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc:

Hello,Kate Giriffiths
We are a reseller and interested in your product. Please submit us a quote (with a granted retailer discount if possible) for the
product listed below.

Pos. Manufacturer Model no. Product name Qty freight

1 Teledyne Code: 0110081 Oxygen sensor 30
UFO 130-2

Among your quotation E-mail please also provide us the following information :

1) lowest EXW price;

2) the weight for products

3) the delivery time.

4) freight charges

5) price list for your products catalog.

6)the country of origin

We look forward to hearing from you as soon as possible and appreciate your cooperation in advance!
2024-01-03

Mit freundlichen GruRen/ Best regards
Jenny.chang

-Einkaufsabteilung/ Purchase department
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Inautom GmbH
Lieferadresse: Nikolaus-Otto-Str. 9 28816 Stuhr

Cell phone: +49-17670532878 (Frau Wei)
Telefon: +49 421 1618 1199

Telefax: +49 (0)421-80936534

E-mail: Jenny.chang@inautom.de

Web: www.inautom.de

Ust.-ID.DE 285897479

EORI: DE864236635297521

“~ Deutsche Bank

IBAN:DE86 3007 0010 0849 9873 00

SWIFT: DEUTDEDDXXX

Bank address: Filiale KOnigsallee 45/47 DUesseldorf 40189 Diiesseldorf

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may

be unlawful.
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